
Marysville City Council Meeting 
 
 

 October 24, 2011                            7:00 p.m.                                   City Hall 

Call to Order

Invocation/Pledge of Allegiance

Roll Call

Committee Report

Presentations

A. Employee Services Awards 

Audience Participation

Approval of Minutes (Written Comment Only Accepted from Audience.)

1. Approval of October 3, 2011 City Council Work Session Minutes. 

2. Approval of October 10, 2011 City Council Meeting Minutes.  

Consent
3. Approval of the October 12, 2011 Claims in the Amount of $320,168.31; Paid 

by Check Number's 72973 through 73110. 

Review Bids

Public Hearings

New Business

4. Interlocal Services Agreement between the City of Duvall and the City of 
Marysville Concerning Provision of Telemetry and SCADA Services and 
Supplemental Work Order between Duvall and Marysville Telemetry and 
SCADA Services Basic Support and Maintenance. 

5. The Hotel/Motel Grant Committee Recommends the City Council Authorize 
the Mayor to Allocate $4,500.00 to Cedarcrest Golf Course; $20,000.00 to 
Maryfest, Inc. dba Marysville Strawberry Festival; $30,000.00 to City of 
Marysville (Chamber of Commerce Visitor Information Center); $30,000.00 to 
Marysville Pilchuck High School Band; $8,155.00 to Greater Marysville Tulalip 
Chamber of Commerce; $6,434.00 to Marysville Historical Society; $2,500.00 
to Marysville YMCA; $12,173.45 to City of Marysville (Special Events 
Funding); $5,910.00 to City of Marysville (Marysville/North Snohomish County 
Visitor's Guide); $8,447.84 to City of Marysville, Streets Division (Strawberry 
Festival Funding) ; $3,297.94 to City of Marysville, Solid Waste Division 
(Strawberry Festival Funding); $2,000.00 to Marysville Kiwanis Club. 

Page 1 of 2



Marysville City Council Meeting   
  

             October 24, 2011                                7:00 p.m.                                        City Hall 

New Business

6. An Ordinance of the City of Marysville Repealing and Replacing Portions of 
Ordinances No. 2739, No. 2532, and No. 2378 Codified in Marysville 
Municipal Code Chapter 9.04; and Adopting a Revised and Updated 
Marysville Municipal Code Chapter 9.04 Entitled "Fire Code"; and Providing 
for Severability. 

7. An Ordinance of the City of Marysville, Washington Amending Ordinance 
2708 and 2740 as Codified in Portions of Marysville Municipal Code 
Chapters 16.04 "Building Code", 16.08 "Plumbing Code, 16.10 "Energy 
Efficiency and Conservation Standards", and 16.28 Mechanical Code; and 
Providing for Severability. 

8. A Resolution of the City of Marysville for the Acceptance of $1,987.56 from 
Marysville Little League Subject to Conditions. 

Legal

Mayor's Business

Staff Business

9. Snohomish County Cities Legislative Agenda for 2011-2012. 

Call on Councilmembers

Executive Session

A. Litigation

B. Personnel

C. Real Estate

Adjourn
Special Accommodations: The City of Marysville strives to provide accessible 
meetings for people with disabilities. Please contact the City Clerk's Office at 
(360) 363-8000 or 1-800-833-6384 (Voice Relay), 1-800-833-6388 (TDD 
Relay) two days prior to the meeting date if any special accommodations are 
needed for this meeting. 
 
 

Page 2 of 2



DRAFT 

 
10/3/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 1 of 5 

COUNCIL MINUTES 
 

Regular Meeting 
October 3, 2011 

 
 

Call to Order / Pledge of Allegiance 
 
Mayor Nehring called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. and led those present in the 
Pledge of Allegiance.  
 
Roll Call 
 
Chief Administrative Officer Hirashima gave the roll call. The following staff and 
councilmembers were in attendance. 
 
Mayor: Jon Nehring 
 
Council: Lee Phillips, Carmen Rasmussen, Jeff Seibert, John 

Soriano, Michael Stevens, Jeff Vaughan, and Donna Wright 
 
Absent: None 
 
Also Present: Chief Administrative Officer Gloria Hirashima, Finance 

Director Sandy Langdon, Commander Robb Lamoureux, 
City Attorney Grant Weed, Public Works Director Kevin 
Nielsen, Senior Planner Chris Holland, Planning Manager 
Cheryl Dungan, IS Manager Worth Norton, Recording 
Secretary Laurie Hugdahl.  

 
Committee Reports  
 
Councilmember Soriano reported on the September 28 Public Safety meeting where the 
following topics were discussed:  

• The Berry Farm Condo Association has recently had problems enforcing traffic 
laws on privately-owned streets. Grant Weed is currently working with our police 
department and the Berry Farm homeowners group to come up with a draft 
agreement to allow policing and traffic enforcement in the area. A WAC code 
exists which allows this type of agreement to be created and entered into. 

• On October 11 there will be a community forum regarding drug abuse and ways 
to deal with it at Marysville Pilchuck High School. 

• Detective activity and investigations are up. Arrests are being made. 
• The Custody Department is working on revisions to the work release program. 

Item 1 - 1



DRAFT 

 
10/3/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 2 of 5 

• Crime statistics were reviewed. Over the past several years since the 
annexation, the number of reported crimes per 1000 people has actually been 
significantly lower. 

 
Presentations 
 
Discussion Items 
 
Approval of Minutes  
 
1.  Approval of September 26, 2011 City Council Meeting Minutes. 
 
Consent 
 
2.  Approval of September 21, 2011 Claims in the Amount of $604,381.54; Paid by 

Check Number’s 72561 through 72683. 
 
3.  Approval of September 20, 2011 Payroll in the Amount of $907,119.46; Paid by 

Check Number's 24716 through 24764. 
 
Review Bids 
 
Public Hearings 
 
New Business 
 
4.  Service Agreement with Frontier Communications Northwest Inc. in the Amount 

of $43,740.00. 
 
IS Manager Worth Norton explained that staff is recommending Frontier 
communications. He explained that Frontier went to the Transportation and Utilities 
Commission and got an Individual Case Basis Price for the City which will save 
significant money over the next three years of this contract over the standard tariff 
prices. Part of the savings will go directly to the departments and part will go to 
improving 911 services. 
 
5.  An Ordinance of the City of Marysville, Affirming the Decision of the Hearing 

Examiner, Rezoning Approximately 2.10-Acres of Property Generally Located 
Between State and Columbia Avenues and 7th and 8th Street from R-8 (Single-
Family, High Density) to DC (Downtown Commercial), and Amending the Official 
Zoning Map of the City. 

 
Chris Holland explained that Marysville School District submitted a rezone for 2.1 acres 
of the existing Totem Middle School site to allow for redevelopment of the area along 
State Avenue in the future. No projects are in the works right now. The Hearing 
Examiner held a public hearing on August 25 and recommended Council approve the 
rezone with the three conditions outlined in the staff recommendation.  

Item 1 - 2



DRAFT 

 
10/3/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 3 of 5 

 
6.  A Resolution of the City of Marysville Affirming the Recommendation of the 

Hearing Examiner and Granting a Conditional Shoreline Substantial 
Development Permit for Qwuloolt Estuary Restoration Project to Allow the 
Construction of a 4,000 LF Levee; Excavation and Removal of 1,800 LF of 
Existing Dike; Creation of 1.1 Acre Fill Pad (Phase 2 & 3 of Christofferson 
Grading Project); and Filling of Agricultural Ditches as Part of a Process to 
Restore Tidal Agricultural Ditches as Part of a Process to Restore Tidal 
Processes to Approximately 341.5 Acres of Fallow Farmland. 

 
Cheryl Dungan stated that on September 13, 2011 the Hearing Examiner issued a 
recommendation to approve the Conditional Shoreline Substantial Development Permit 
subject to ten conditions. This would allow a 4,000 lineal foot levee to be constructed 
along the west project boundary, excavation and removal of 1,800 linear feet of existing 
dyke, creation of approximately a 1.1 acre fill pad, provide public access easements to 
the shoreline and fill the remaining agricultural ditches within the project bounds as part 
of the process to restore tidal processes to approximately 341 acres of fallow farmland. 
She reviewed the highlights of this project and the studies that have been done 
regarding the project. Staff is recommending that Council authorize the Mayor to sign 
the Resolution approving the Conditional Shoreline Substantial Development Permit.  
 
Councilmember Wright noted that on the staff recommendation on page 21, it states 
that, “Prior to levee removal, the applicant must either secure ownership of all parcels 
within the project work area and/or obtain flood easements over the affected properties.” 
She asked if this has been done. Ms. Dungan replied that they are still in the process of 
doing this.  
 
Legal 
 
Mayor’s Business 
 
7.  Tulalip Tribes Class III Gaming Proceeds Thank You Letter. 
 
A copy of the letter to the Tulalip Tribes Board of Directors thanking them for their 
generous gift of $35,000 will be available for signing by Council next week. 
 
Other items: 

• The Snohomish County Tomorrow General Assembly last Wednesday was very 
well attended by Marysville. He expressed appreciation to those who attended. It 
was good to review the county-wide planning policies that were completed over 
the prior two years. 

• The Domestic Violence Services luncheon was very well attended. 
• Thanks to Public Works, Parks, Police and all who attended the Bayview Trail 

Ribbon cutting last week.  
 

Item 1 - 3



DRAFT 

 
10/3/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 4 of 5 

Staff Business 
 
Sandy Langdon: 

• She and Denise Gritton attended the Department of Revenue Partnership 
meeting. They are working on a tax simplification program for small businesses. 
There is a draft report on their website for those interested. They also gave an 
update on federal proposals. There are about three proposals regarding state 
revenues of sales tax and the federal streamlining aspect.  

• Local streamlined sales taxes will be discussed in Seattle this week.  
• League fees are now taxed.  
• She and Denise Gritton both passed the CPFIM (Certified Public Funds 

Investment Managers) test. 
 
Kevin Nielsen: 

• Public Works Committee will be held this Friday at 2:00.  
• Interlocal on the Debris Management Plan should be coming to the City by the 

middle of October. There are some details that need to be worked out with the 
Interlocal Agreement that Grant Weed is currently working on. 

• Staff will be commenting on the Snohomish County Plan. 
• Ribbon cutting was very nice event. 
• Weather patterns are going to be changing. Staff is looking at problem areas to 

try to prevent flooding. 
 
Chief Smith: 

• The dedication of the Bayview Trail was a great event. Lisa Brenton and family 
thanked the City. They greatly appreciated the dedication.  

• There will be a community forum on October 11 regarding drugs. There will be 
another one in November on personal safety and security. 

• He gave an update on the arrest of a recent homicide suspect that Marysville 
police played a part in.  

• He gave an update on the jail management system. 
 
Grant Weed: 

• He explained that his office has prepared an agreement that would allow for 
traffic enforcement in the Berry Farms Homeowners Association. The agreement 
is currently being reviewed by the Police Department.  

• He will be at the Washington Association of Municipal Attorneys Conference in 
Coeur d’Alene on Thursday and Friday of this week. 

 
Gloria Hirashima informed Council that staff is trying to schedule a full board meeting 
with Tulalip Tribes and the City Council. There was discussion about possible Council 
availability.  
 

Item 1 - 4



DRAFT 

 
10/3/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 5 of 5 

Call on Councilmembers 
 
Michael Stevens congratulated the Marysville School District for winning the top award 
for innovative school design for Getchell High School by the Council for Educational 
Facility Planners Institute.  
 
Carmen Rasmussen commented that the Bayview Trail opening and ribbon cutting was 
a great event. This is a nice addition to the recreational opportunities in Marysville. 
 
Jeff Vaughan also enjoyed the ribbon cutting. 
 
Lee Phillips appreciated the ribbon cutting. He was glad to see that it could be done in-
house. 
 
Donna Wright also appreciated the ribbon cutting. She reminded everyone that the 
Soroptomist International Marysville Auction Saturday, October 22.  
 
John Soriano also complimented the ribbon cutting. His family has been enjoying the 
trail quite a bit already. 
 
Jeff Seibert thought the ribbon-cutting was a great event. He enjoyed walking the trail 
that morning. 
 
Adjournment 
 
Seeing no further business Mayor Nehring adjourned the meeting at 7:26 p.m. 
 
Approved this _______ day of ___________________, 2011. 
 
 
_________________________ ________________________  
Mayor April O’Brien 
Jon Nehring Deputy City Clerk 
 
 
 

Item 1 - 5



October 10, 2011 7:00 p.m. City Hall 
 

Page 1 of 1 

Call to Order/Pledge of Allegiance/Roll Call 7:00 p.m.
Presentations 
Volunteers of the Month - Jean Wilson and Goldie Landis Presented
Proclamation - Friends of the Library   Presented
Proclamation - DECA Week   Presented
Approval of Minutes  
Approval of the September 26, 2011 City Council Regular Meeting 
Minutes 

Approved

Consent Agenda  
Approval of September 21, 2011 Claims in the Amount of $604,381.54; 
Paid by Check Numbers 72561 through 72683. 

Approved

Approval of September 20, 2011 Payroll in the Amount of $907,119.46; 
Paid by Check Number's 24716 through 24764. 

Approved

Authorize the Mayor to Sign the Service Agreement with Frontier 
Communications Northwest Inc. in the Amount of $43,740.00. 

Approved

Approval of the October 5, 2011 Payroll in the Amount of $1,371,313.92; 
Paid by Check Number's 24765 through 24816. 

Approved

Approval of the October 5, 2011 Claims in the Amount of $1,271,824.47; 
Paid by Check Number's 72847 through 72972 with Check Number's 
70991 and 72844 Voided. 

Approved

Approval of the September 28, 2011 Claims in the Amount of 
$747,067.90; Paid by Check Number's 72684 through 72846.  

Approved

New Business 
An Ordinance of the City of Marysville, Affirming the Decision of the 
Hearing Examiner, Rezoning Approximately 2.10-Acres of Property 
Generally Located Between State and Columbia Avenues and 7th and 
8th Street from R-8(Single-Family, High Density) to DC (Downtown 
Commercial), and Amending the Official Zoning Map of the City. 

Approved
Ord. No. 2874

A Resolution of the City of Marysville Affirming the Recommendation of 
the Hearing Examiner and Granting a Conditional Shoreline Substantial 
Development Permit for Qwuloolt Estuary Restoration Project to Allow the 
Construction of a 4,000 LF Levee; Excavation and Removal of 1,800 LF 
of Existing Dike; Creation of 1.1 Acre Fill Pad (Phase 2 & 3 of 
Christofferson Grading Project); and Filling of Agricultural Ditches as Part 
of a Process to Restore Tidal Agricultural Ditches as Part of a Process to 
Restore Tidal Processes to Approximately 341.5 Acres of Fallow 
Farmland. Motion passed unanimously (7-0). 

Approved
Res. No. 2309

Legal 
Mayor’s Business 
Tulalip Tribes Class III Gaming Proceeds Thank You Letter. Signed
Staff Business 
Call on Councilmembers 
Adjournment 8:42 p.m.
 

Item 2 - 1



DRAFT 

 
10/10/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 1 of 6 

COUNCIL MINUTES 
 

Regular Meeting 
October 10, 2011 

 
 

Call to Order / Pledge of Allegiance 
 
Mayor Nehring called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. and led those present in the 
Pledge of Allegiance. The invocation was given by Steve Schertzinger or Resurgence 
Ministries. 
 
Roll Call 
 
Chief Administrative Officer Hirashima gave the roll call. The following staff and 
councilmembers were in attendance. 
 
Mayor: Jon Nehring 
 
Council: Lee Phillips, Carmen Rasmussen, Jeff Seibert, John 

Soriano, Michael Stevens, Jeff Vaughan, and Donna Wright 
 
Absent: None 
 
Also Present: Chief Administrative Officer Gloria Hirashima, Finance 

Director Sandy Langdon, Commander Robb Lamoureux, 
City Attorney Grant Weed, Public Works Director Kevin 
Nielsen, Land Use Planning Manager Cheryl Dungan, Chief 
Information Officer Doug Buell, Parks and Recreation 
Director Jim Ballew, Recording Secretary Laurie Hugdahl.  

 
Committee Reports  
 
Councilmember Philips reported that the Hotel Motel Tax Grant Committee met today 
and heard presentations by applicants. 12 out of 13 applicants will be receiving funding. 
This will be coming to Council in November. 
 
Councilmember Seibert reported on the October 7 Public Works Committee. At the 
meeting there was a presentation regarding options for walking paths. There was also 
discussion about the 1st Street bypass, Sunnyside shoulder improvements, connections 
to Centennial Trail and other multimodal connections, and a solid waste review to see 
whether or not we want to expand into the central annexation area. Public Works will be 
doing tabletop exercises, with other departments, to prepare new employees for 
upcoming retirements. Crews replaced 216 feet of old pipe at Edward Springs. 

Item 2 - 2



DRAFT 

 
10/10/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 2 of 6 

 
Presentations 
 
A. Volunteer of the Month  
 
Jean Wilson and Goldie Landis were recognized for their outstanding service as 
volunteers at the Ken Baxter community center. The two have a combined average of 
65 to 70 hours a month. Each brings something special and unique to the center’s 
operations. Mayor Nehring reviewed their many contributions and thanked them both for 
the work that they do.  
 
B. Proclamation - Friends of the Library   
 
Mayor Nehring read the proclamation designating the week of October 16, 2011 as 
Friends of the Library Week.   
  
C.  Proclamation - DECA Week   
 
Mayor Nehring read the proclamation recognizing October 9-15, 2011 as DECA Week 
and presented the proclamation to DECA leader Will Hill and six students who were 
present. 
 
Audience Participation  
 
Preston Dwoskin, 11120 46th Avenue NE, Marysville, WA, 98271, spoke on behalf of 
disabled citizens and informed the Council that October is Disability Awareness Month.  
 
Approval of Minutes  
 
1.  Approval of September 26, 2011 City Council Meeting Minutes.   
 
Councilmember Phillips referred to page 5 under Hotel Motel Committee Members 
Appointments. In the last sentence of the first paragraph, the spelling of his name 
should be corrected to Phillips.  
 
Motion made by Councilmember Vaughan, seconded by Councilmember Phillips, to 
approve the September 26, 2011 City Council Meeting Minutes as corrected. Motion 
passed unanimously (7-0). 
 
Consent  
 
2.  Approval of September 21, 2011 Claims in the Amount of $604,381.54; Paid by 

Check Numbers 72561 through 72683. 
 
3.  Approval of September 20, 2011 Payroll in the Amount of $907,119.46; Paid by 

Check Number's 24716 through 24764. 
 

Item 2 - 3



DRAFT 

 
10/10/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 3 of 6 

4.  Authorize the Mayor to Sign the Service Agreement with Frontier 
Communications Northwest Inc. in the Amount of $43,740.00. 

 
8.  Approval of the October 5, 2011 Payroll in the Amount of $1,371,313.92; Paid by 

Check Number's 24765 through 24816.   
 
9.  Approval of the October 5, 2011 Claims in the Amount of $1,271,824.47; Paid by 

Check Number's 72847 through 72972 with Check Number's 70991 and 72844 
Voided.   

  
10.  Approval of the September 28, 2011 Claims in the Amount of $747,067.90; Paid 

by Check Number's 72684 through 72846.   
 
Motion made by Councilmember Wright, seconded by Councilmember Soriano, to 
approve Consent Agenda items 2, 3, 4, 8, 9 and 10. Motion passed unanimously (7-0). 
 
Review Bids  
 
None 
 
Public Hearings   
 
None 
 
New Business  
 
5.  An Ordinance of the City of Marysville, Affirming the Decision of the Hearing 

Examiner, Rezoning Approximately 2.10-Acres of Property Generally Located 
Between State and Columbia Avenues and 7th and 8th Street from R-8(Single-
Family, High Density) to DC (Downtown Commercial), and Amending the Official 
Zoning Map of the City. 

 
CAO Hirashima explained that this is a recommendation by the Hearing Examiner to 
rezone a portion of the Totem Middle School site. The Marysville School District applied 
for a rezone from R-8 to Downtown commercial. Staff is in support of the 
recommendation. 
 
Motion made by Councilmember Rasmussen, seconded by Councilmember Stevens, 
to approve Ordinance No. 2874, an Ordinance of the City of Marysville, Affirming the 
Decision of the Hearing Examiner, Rezoning Approximately 2.10-Acres of Property 
Generally Located Between State and Columbia Avenues and 7th and 8th Street from 
R-8(Single-Family, High Density) to DC (Downtown Commercial), and Amending the 
Official Zoning Map of the City. Motion passed unanimously (7-0). 
  
6. A Resolution of the City of Marysville Affirming the Recommendation of the 

Hearing Examiner and Granting a Conditional Shoreline Substantial 
Development Permit for Qwuloolt Estuary Restoration Project to Allow the 

Item 2 - 4



DRAFT 

 
10/10/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 4 of 6 

Construction of a 4,000 LF Levee; Excavation and Removal of 1,800 LF of 
Existing Dike; Creation of 1.1 Acre Fill Pad (Phase 2 & 3 of Christofferson 
Grading Project); and Filling of Agricultural Ditches as Part of a Process to 
Restore Tidal Agricultural Ditches as Part of a Process to Restore Tidal 
Processes to Approximately 341.5 Acres of Fallow Farmland.  

 
Planning Manager Cheryl Dungan discussed the proposed resolution. There were no 
comments or questions. 
 
Motion made by Councilmember Soriano, seconded by Councilmember Seibert, to 
approve Resolution 2309, a Resolution of the City of Marysville Affirming the 
Recommendation of the Hearing Examiner and Granting a Conditional Shoreline 
Substantial Development Permit for Qwuloolt Estuary Restoration Project to Allow the 
Construction of a 4,000 LF Levee; Excavation and Removal of 1,800 LF of Existing 
Dike; Creation of 1.1 Acre Fill Pad (Phase 2 & 3 of Christofferson Grading Project); and 
Filling of Agricultural Ditches as Part of a Process to Restore Tidal Agricultural Ditches 
as Part of a Process to Restore Tidal Processes to Approximately 341.5 Acres of Fallow 
Farmland. Motion passed unanimously (7-0). 
 
Legal - None 
 
Mayor's Business  
 
7.  Tulalip Tribes Class III Gaming Proceeds Thank You Letter.  
 
Mayor Nehring distributed for Council’s signatures the thank you letter to the Tulalip 
Tribes Board of Directors thanking them for their generous $35,000 contribution.  
 
Other Mayor’s Business: 

• He attended the grand opening of Rhythm Fitness Studio. He was pleased to see 
this building active and off to a great start. 

• The Community Transit Board of Directors has started their budget process for 
2012. 

 
Staff Business 
 
Jim Ballew: 

• Craft Show this weekend. 
• They received a donation from the Marysville Little League to cover the 

necessary repairs to the playground that was shut down due to vandalism.  
 
Chief Smith: 

• There will be a community forum tomorrow night from 7-8:30 at Marysville 
Pilchuck High School. Lt. Rasmussen has an extremely ambitious agenda 
prepared. Thanks to the Marysville Community Coalition, Parks and Marysville 
School District for helping to put this together. 

Item 2 - 5



DRAFT 

 
10/10/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 5 of 6 

• Police made an arrest on a dognapping case. Officers did an outstanding job with 
this matter. He clarified that Police did not pursue the media attention, but the 
victim did. 

• He gave an update on the animal shelter issue. He commented that so far this 
year they have collected $2,700 in revenue through billing. In addition, the animal 
shelter has credited the City with $9,700. Year to date they are actually under by 
about $33,000 from last year. He thinks the action they took was appropriate and 
correct.  

 
Kevin Nielsen: 

• He informed the Council and Mayor that Joel Palm will be retiring this Friday. 
There will be a retirement /going away party on Tuesday. 

• SR 9 Steering Committee will be meeting on October 21 at 10 a.m. in 
Snohomish.  

• He attended Lakewood School District’s cross country meet with 50 schools and 
about 400 runners, which was a very impressive event. 

 
Doug Buell informed the Council that the Marysville Arts Coalition will be selling hand-
painted wood wreaths to the community for $30. They will be hung along lampposts on 
State Avenue and some other locations. The Arts and Technology students in the wood 
program will be cutting out the wreaths and local artists will be painting them. The 
money raised will go to provide future art activities in the community. 
 
Cheryl Dungan had no further comments. 
 
Sandy Langdon had no further comments. 
 
Grant Weed attended the Washington State Municipal Attorneys conference where the 
following topics were discussed: 

• Updates on land use law 
• Medical marijuana issue 
• Information on cases involving the Public Records Act 
• Litigation against Burlington and Mt. Vernon concerning a lawsuit related to 

public defender agreements 
• Update on criminal law cases 
• Recent decision on stormwater liability 
• State auditor’s office information regarding financial audit issues 

 
Gloria Hirashima 

• The Planning Commission had hearing on impact fee deferral ordinance. There 
was testimony at the hearing about impact fee reductions. The Planning 
Commission decided to postpone the hearing; they have requested a joint 
workshop with the City Council to discuss this issue.  

• She has issued a response regarding the City’s position on the bikini barista 
issue. 

• The first gateway sign will be erected at Lakewood.  

Item 2 - 6



DRAFT 

 
10/10/11 City Council Meeting Minutes 

Page 6 of 6 

• Next year the City will receive the first allocation for the Community Development 
Block Grant program since the City has exceeded the 50,000 population mark. 
Staff has been meeting with the HUD office contacts to start developing a plan to 
identify how the funds will be used. Within the next eight months the City will 
need to adopt a consolidated plan that shows the kinds of programs that the City 
will want to fund. 

 
Call on Councilmembers 
 
Carmen Rasmussen: 

• The Fire District Board of Directors will be meeting for their annual retreat and 
will be beginning the budget process. Anyone is welcome to attend. The meeting 
will begin at 8 a.m at Station 62.  

• She will be out of town most of next week for work-related training.  
• She is looking forward to getting a “WSU Cougar” wreath.  

 
Lee Phillips had no comments. 
 
Soriano had no comments. 
 
Michael Stevens:  

• He agreed that the facelift to the building where the new Rhythm Fitness Studio 
is housed has really transformed the building.  

• He liked the idea of neighborhood identifiers on the gateway signs to establish 
the identities of the different areas in town.  

 
Jeff Vaughan had no comments. 
 
Donna Wright had no comments. 
 
Jeff Seibert had no comments. 
 
Adjournment 
 
Seeing no further business Mayor Nehring adjourned the meeting at 7:42 p.m. 
 
Approved this _______ day of ___________________, 2011. 
 
 
_________________________ ________________________  
Mayor April O’Brien 
Jon Nehring Deputy City Clerk 
 
 
 

Item 2 - 7



CITY OF MARYSVILLE 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY FOR ACTION 

CITY COUNCIL MEETING DATE: October 24, 2011 

AGENDA ITEM: 
Claims 

AGENDA SECTION: 

AGENDA NUMBER: 

APPROVED BY: 

MAYOR ICAO 

AMOUNT: 

PREPARED BY: 
Sandy Langdon, Finance Director 

ATTACHMENTS: 
Claims Listings 

BUDGET CODE: 

Please see attached. 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 

The Finance and Executive Departments recommend City Council approve the October 
12,2011 claims in the amount of$320,168.31 paid by Check No.'s 72973 through 
73110. 
COUNCIL ACTION: 

Item 3 - 1



BLANKET CERTIFICATION 
CLAIMS 

FOR 
PERIOD-10 

I, THE UNDERSIGNED, DO HEREBY CERTIFY UNDER PENALTY OF PERJURY THAT THE 
MATERIALS HAVE BEEN FURNISHED, THE SERVICES RENDERED OR THE LABOR PERFORMED 
AS DESCRIBED HEREIN AND THAT THE CLAIMS IN THE AMOUNT OF $320,168.31 PAID 
BY CHECK NO.' S 72973 THROUGH 73110 ARE JUST, DUE AND UNPAID OBLIGATIONS 
AGAINST THE CITY OF MARYSVILLE, AND THAT I AM AUTHORIZED TO AUTHENTICATE 
AND TO CERTIFY SAID CLAIMS. 

MAYOR 

AUDITING OFFICER --, 
/f 

WE, THE UNDER:IGNED COUNCIL!. BERS OF MARYSVILLE, WASHINGTON DO HEREBY 
APPROVE FOR PAYMENT THE ABOVE MENTIONED CLAIMS ON THIS 24TH DAY OF OCTOBER 
2011. 

COUNCIL MEMBER COUNCIL MEMBER 

COUNCIL MEMBER COUNCIL MEMBER 

COUNCIL MEMBER COUNCIL MEMBER 

COUNCIL MEMBER
 

Item 3 - 2



DATE:	 10/7/20II CITY OF MARYSVILLE PAGE: I 
TIME:	 8:26:; lAM INVOICE LIST 

CHK# VENDOR 

72973	 3M 

3M 
72974 AAA FIRE & SAFETY 
72975 ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 

ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 
ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 

ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 
ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 
ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 
ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 
ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 
ADVANTAGE BUILDING S 

72976	 AFTS 
AFTS 
AFTS 

72977	 BENKOMATIC 
72978	 BICKFORD FORD 

BICKFORD FORD 
BICKFORD FORD 

72979 BLACK ROCK CABLE INC 
72980 BRENNAN,SHANNON 
72981 BRODIE, KATHLEEN 
72982 BURKE, MARILYN 
72983 CARRS ACE 

CARRS ACE 
CARRS ACE 
CARRS ACE 

72984	 CEMEX 
CEMEX 
CEMEX 

72985 CHAMPION BOLT 
72986 CODE PUBLISHING 
72987 COLE, BRIAN E 
72988 COLUMBIA PAINT 

COLUMBIA PAINT 
72989 CONCRETE NOR'WEST 
72990 COOP SUPPLY 

COOP SUPPLY 
COOP SUPPLY 
COOP SUPPLY 
COOP SUPPLY 
COOP SUPPLY 
COOP SUPPLY 

72991 CORPORATE OFFICE SPL 
72992 CORRECT EQUIPMENT 
72993 CREIGHTON ENGINEERIN 
72994 CROMBIE, DOROTHY 
72995 DANH, HOC & LOC 
72996 DAY WIRELESS SYSTEMS 

DAY WIRELESS SYSTEMS 
72997	 DIAMOND B CONSTRUCT 

DIAMOND B CONSTRUCT 
DIAMOND B CONSTRUCT 

72998	 DICKS TOWING
 
DICKS TOWING
 
DiCKS TOWING
 

'2999	 DIVERSINT 

FOR INVOICES FROM 10/6/2011 TO 10/12/2011 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

9"X100YD ROLL TRANSFER TAPE 
30"X50YD ROLL 1160 FILM 

CO2 
JANITORIAL SERVICES 

REMITIANCE PROCESSING 
WEB PAYMENT SERVICES 
BILL PRINTING SERVICES 
RUDDER PUMP CHECK VALVE 
FRONT BRAKE PAD SET 
LEFT EXHAUST MANIFOLD 
ENGINE COOLING FAN ASSEMBLY 
I-NET TELEMETRY EXTENSION 
INSTRUCTOR SERVICES 

UB 331412815000 14900 44TH DR 
OIL CAN 

SHOP RAGS, SMALL PROPANE, WD 4 
PADLOCKS (18) 
MOD B ASPHALT 

MOD B & LIQUID ASPHALT 
MISC. BOLTS 
MMC ELECTRONIC UPDATE 
UB 221260000000 4617 122ND PL 
PAINT & RAGS 
PAINT TIPS 
MORTAR SAND 
PAINT SUPPLIES 
SMALL TOOLS 
GRASS SEED 
AUTO FUEL DISPENSING NOZZLE 
STRAW BALES 

STRAW BALES & GRASS SEED 
WYPALL & PURELL WIPES 
BACK UP SPARE PARTS 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 
UB 050370000000 9316 60TH DR N 
UB 987001380000 7001 38TH PL N 
PINPOINT X MODEM INSTALL 

SERVICE AlC COMPRESSOR-PSB 
SERVICE ROOF UNITS 
INSTALL NEW TXX VALVE-PSB 
TOWING EXPENSE MP 11-6450 

TOWING EXPENSE MP 11-6474 
UB REPLACEMENT PARTS 

ACCOUNT ITEM
 
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
 

TRANSPORTATION MANAGE~ 87.97 

TRANSPORTATION MANAGE~ 900.02 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 54.60 
WATER FILTRATION PLANT 37.73 
MAINT OF GENL PLANT 67.86 
WASTE WATER TREATMENT 403.76 
COMMUNITY CENTER 435.49 
ADMIN FACILITIES 535.16 
PUBLIC SAFETY FAC-GENL 605.88 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 620.40 
COURT FACILITIES 950.52 
UTIL ADMIN 1,032.75 
UTILITY BILLING 1,033.80 
UTILITY BILLING 1,250.25 
UTILITY BILLING 7,369.64 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 815.38 
ER&R 130.28 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 169.75 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 363.47 
CENTRAL SERVICES 493.50 
COMMUNITY CENTER 168.00 
RECREATION SERVICES 525.00 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 27.17 
WATER CROSS CNTL 8.13 
HYDRANTS 14.65 
TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES 56.96 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 214.82 
WATER SUPPLY MAINS 347.42 
ROADWAY MAINTENANCE 558.63 
SEWER MAIN COLLECTION 835.19 
WASTE WATER TREATMENT 41.07 
CITY CLERK 612.11 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 12.55 
PUMPING PLANT 71.74 
TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES 106.44 
MAINTENANCE 1,590.61 
TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES 10.83 
HYDRANTS 30.36 
SOURCE OF SUPPLY 54.29 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 76.01 
STORM DRAINAGE 108.49 
STORM DRAINAGE 108.49 
SOURCE OF SUPPLY 108.53 
ER&R 293.09 
WASTE WATER TREATMENT 654.86 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT­ 420.00 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 315.56 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 106.56 
TRIBAL GAMING-GENL 283.92 
TRIBAL GAMING-GENL 283.92 
PUBLIC SAFETY FAC-GENL 365.44 
NON-DEPARTMENTAL 369.10 

PUBLIC SAFETY FAC-GENL 1,032.17 

POLICE PATROL 43.44 
POLICE PATROL 43.44 
POLICE PATROL 43.44 
COMPUTER SERVICES 188.96 

Item 3 - 3



DATE:	 1017/20 I I CITY OF MARYSVILLE PAGE: 2 
TIME:	 8:26:ilAM INVOICE LIST 

CHK # VENDOR 

73000	 DONNELSON, DIANE 
73001	 DUNLAP INDUSTRIAL 

DUNLAP INDUSTRIAL 
DUNLAP INDUSTRIAL 
DUNLAP INDUSTRIAL 

73002	 DURAND, JOANN 
73003	 E&E LUMBER 

E&E LUMBER 
E&ELUMBER 
E&ELUMBER 
E&E LUMBER 
E&E LUMBER 
E&E LUMBER 
E&E LUMBER 
E&E LUMBER 
E&E LUMBER 

73004	 ECOLOGY, DEPT. OF 
73005	 EKSTROM, KIP & DONNA 
73006	 ENDRESS+HAUSER, INC. 
73007	 EVERED HYDRAULICS 
73008	 EVERED MUNICIPAL 
73009	 EVERED, CITY OF 
73010	 FCS GROUP 
73011 FELDMAN & LEE P.S. 
73012 FLOYD, CHRIS 
73013	 GOEDEN, SHARON 
73014	 GONZALES, APRIL 
73015	 GOVCONNECTION INC 
73016	 GREENSHIELDS 
73017 GROUP MOBILE INT'L L 

GROUP MOBILE INT'L L 
73018 GYURKOVICS, SANDRA 

GYURKOVICS, SANDRA 
GYURKOVICS, SANDRA 

73019 HARBOR FREIGHT TOOLS 
HARBOR FREIGHT TOOLS 

73020 HADON, DORIS 
73021 HD FOWLER COMPANY 

HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 
HD FOWLER COMPANY 

'3022 HOUK, SUSAN 
'3023 HSBC BUSINESS SOL UTI 
'3024 HUBER PROPERTY MANAG 
'3025 IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 

IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 

FOR INVOICES FROM 10/6/2011 TO 10/12/2011 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

UB 601350000006 3704 122ND ST 
PRESSURE WASHER FIDINGS 
REPLACE AUTO DRIVE CABLE 
DEWALT ROTO HAMMER KIT 
HEDGE TRIMMER 
TRIP REFUND 
FELT PADS 
ROLLER COVERS 
MOTOR OIL 
WIRE CUDERS 
GRAFFITI SUPPLIES 
2X4X8 DOUG FIR 
GRAFFITI SUPPLIES 
BROOMS, SCRUB BRUSHES 
COUPLER, PLUGS, KNEE PADS 
MISC. SUPPLIES 
BIOSOLIDS PERMIT FEES 
UB 830316200000 6907 71ST AVE 
ELECTRONICS FEB22 HART 
RESEAL CYLINDER & REPLACE SNAP 
BAIL POSTED 
ANIMALS TO SHELTER-AUG. 2011 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 
PUBLIC DEFENDER 
INSTRUCTOR SERVICES 
CLASS REFUND 
UB 45801000000214114 51ST DR 
CCTV VIDEO CARD REPLACEMENT 
MISC. SUPPLIES 
2 NO-DRIL VEHICLE MOUNT LAPTOP 

MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT 

CREDIT-RETURN ITEMS 
MISC. SMALL TOOLS 
CLASS REFUND 
PARTS 
STAPLES 
RED DYE TABLETS 
COUPLINGS, IRON PIPE THREADS 
PARTS 
QUICK JOINT COUPLINGS 
MARKING PAINT,TAPE MEASURES,ET 
1" COPPER TUBING 
3/4" COPPER TUBING 
POLYMER CONCRETE LIDS 

PERF PIPE,SOLID CORE PIPE 
MISC. WATER SERVICE PARTS 
TRIP REFUND 
SUPPLY REIMBURSEMENT 
UB 249999999901 10525 57TH DR 
COPIER CHARGES 

ACCOUNT ITEM
 
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
 

WATER/SEWER OPERATION 53.80 
HYDRANTS 51.04 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 51.85 
STORM DRAINAGE 450.36 
STORM DRAINAGE 502.27 
PARKS-RECREATION 96.00 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 6.43 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 6.83 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 8.23 
WATER SERVICES 9.76 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT­ 12.28 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 23.14 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT­ 28.28 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 50.02 
WASTE WATER TREATMENT 62.65 
ER&R 283.09 
UTIL ADMIN 3,091.43 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 216.60 
WATER FILTRATION PLANT 1,386.40 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 202.02 
GENERAL FUND 750.00 
ANIMAL CONTROL 8,990.00 
WATER CAPITAL PROJECTS 3,468.75 
LEGAL - PUBLIC DEFENSE 15,000.00
 
RECREATION SERVICES 831.36
 
PARKS-RECREATION 15.00
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 26.47
 
SEWER MAIN COLLECTION 38.56
 
ER&R 425.03
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION -39.56
 
STORM DRAINAGE 499.56
 
COMPUTER SERVICES 31.08
 
COMPUTER SERVICES 38.85
 
COMPUTER SERVICES 54.11
 
HYDRANTS INSTALLATION -113.39
 
WATER SUPPLY MAINS 122.76
 
PARKS-RECREATION 29.00
 
SEWER MAIN COLLECTION 23.75
 
STORM DRAINAGE 32.58
 
PUBLIC SAFETY FAC-GENL 43.01
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 105.02
 
SEWER MAIN COLLECTION 196.58
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 214.62
 
ER&R 287.43
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 387.05
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 463.98
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 577.49
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 577.49
 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 622.35
 
WATER SERVICE INSTALL 1,788.15
 
PARKS-RECREATION 96.00
 
PERSONNEL ADMINISTRATIO 93.17
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 80.27
 
MAINTENANCE 21.72
 
WASTE WATER TREATMENT 37.86
 
COMMUNITY CENTER 44.53
 
GENERAL SERVICES - OVER~ 87.90
 

Item 3 - 4



DATE:	 10/7/2011 CITY OF MARYSVILLE PAGE: 3 
TIME:	 8:26:lIAM INVOICE LIST 

CHK# VENDOR 

73025	 IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 

IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 

IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 
IKON OFFICE SOLUTION 

73026 INFILCO DEGREMONT 
73027 INTEGRA CHEMICAL CO 
73028 INTERSTATE AUTO PART 

INTERSTATE AUTO PART 
73029 K & M DEVELOPMENT LL 
73030 KNOPP, BECKY 
73031 KONTEH, CATHERINE 
73032 KUNG FU 4 KIDS 
73033 KUROSE-BRETZKE, FUM I 
73034 LARSONNARNELL 
73035 LAWSON PRODUCTS 
73036 LEAL, ANGEL 
73037 LES SCHWAB TIRE CTR 
73038 LICENSING, DEPT OF 

LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING, DEPT OF 
LICENSING. DEPT OF 

73039 M-B COMPANIES, INC. 
73040 MARYSVILLE AWARDS 
73041 MARYSVILLE CHILDREN 
73042 MARYSVILLE PRINTING 
73043 MARYSVILLE, CITY OF 
73044 MCANGUS, RACHEL 
r3045 MCLOUGHLIN & EARDLEY 

MCLOUGHLIN & EARDLEY 
73046 METCALF. SHELLEY 
73047 MILLS, JENNIFER 
73048 MITCHELL, ANNE 
73049 MIZELL, TARA 

MIZELL, TARA 
'3050 MOTOROLA 

'3051 NELSON PETROLEUM 

'3052 NEWMAN TRAFFIC SIGNS 
NEWMAN TRAFFIC SIGNS 

73053 NORTH COAST ELECTRIC 
NORTH COAST ELECTRIC 

FOR INVOICES FROM 10/6/2011 TO 10/12/2011 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

COPIER CHARGES 

BALLASTS 
VITA D-CHLOR TABLETS 
RED & BLUE LED LIGHT 
PRY BAR SET, LED WORKLIGHT 
UB 980098000334 7714 31ST ST N 
CLASS REFUND 
REFUND 
INSTRUCTOR SERVICES 

UB 225222000000 5222 122ND PL 
SUPPLIES-GOLF COURSE 
REFUND 
MICHELEN STEER AXLE TIRES 
ADAMS. DOROTHY (RENEWAL) 
COCHRAN, GUY (ORIGINAL) 
CONCEPCION. ALiSHA (ORIGINAL) 
FOSTER, ANTHONY (ORIGINAL) 
GOODNER, MICHAEL (RENEWAL) 
PHILLIPS, CALVIN (ORIGINAL) 
PILON, JOHN (RENEWAL) 
RIPLEY, FRANKLIN (ORIGINAL) 
THURN, JEANNINE (ORIGINAL) 
WASHINGTON, JANE (RENEWAL) 
PROPANE BURNER TIPS 
PLAQUES FOR BAYVIEW TRAIL DEDI 
UB 989191040000 919 STATE AVE 
LAMINATING SHEETS 
WTR/SWR-7610 47TH AVE NE 
UB 987743320000 7743 32ND ST N 
BULB STROBE REPLACEMENT 

INSTRUCTOR SERVICES 
UB 141371000001 12129 42ND DR 
REFUND 
SUPPLY REIMBURSEMENT 

RADIO REPAIR 

GAS & DIESEL 
MISC. ITEMS FOR SIGN SHOP 

FUSE 

ACCOUNT ITEM 
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT 

PROBATION 119.46 

LEGAL - PROSECUTION 130.98 
POLICE INVESTIGATION 163.99 
UTILITY BILLING 178.48 
EXECUTIVE ADMIN 185.90 
PERSONNEL ADMINISTRATIO 192.84
 

ENGR-GENL 197.12
 
CITY CLERK 199.08
 
FINANCE-GENL 199.08
 
DETENTION & CORRECTION 260.48
 
MUNICIPAL COURTS 299.18
 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 345.35
 
UTIL ADMIN 448.88
 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT- 655.52
 
OFFICE OPERATIONS 1,021.93
 
WASTE WATER TREATMENT 1,383.57
 
WATER SUPPLY MAINS 662.07
 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 130.21
 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 227.95
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 33.24
 
PARKS-RECREATION 145.00
 
PARKS-RECREATION 34.00
 
RECREATION SERVICES 623.00
 
COMMUNITY CENTER 201.60
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 28.79
 
MAINTENANCE 153.90
 
PARKS-RECREATION 34.00
 
ER&R 1,843.73
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
GENERAL FUND 18.00
 
TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES 59.36
 
COMMUNITY EVENTS 450.67
 
GARBAGE 2,755.73
 
PARK & RECREATION FAC 10.86
 
MAlNT OF GENL PLANT 212.42
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 197.61
 
ER&R -10.02
 
ER&R 126.57
 
RECREATION SERVICES 604.80
 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 13.88
 
PARKS-RECREATION 29.00
 
GENERAL FUND -3.64
 
RECREATION SERVICES 45.93
 
POLICE PATROL 426.80
 

MAINTENANCE 1,087.85
 
CITY STREETS -1,047.64
 
TRANSPORTATION MANAGEr-- 13,229.45
 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 29.33
 
EQUIPMENT RENTAL 67.69
 

Item 3 - 5



DATE: 10/7/20 II CITY OF MARYSVILLE PAGE: 4 
TIME-: 8:26: IIAM INVOICE LIST 

FOR INVOICES FROM 10/6/2011 TO 10/12/2011 

CHK# VENDOR ITEM DESCRIPTION 
ACCOUNT 

DESCRIPTION 
ITEM 

AMOUNT 

73054 NORTHSTAR CHEMICAL SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE WATER QUAL TREATMENT 447.43 

NORTHSTAR CHEMICAL WATER FILTRATION PLANT 447.43 

NORTHSTAR CHEMICAL WATER QUAL TREATMENT 654.20 
NORTHSTAR CHEMICAL WATER FILTRATION PLANT 654.21 

73055 NORTHWEST CASCADE HONEY BUCKET PARK & RECREATION FAC 93.50 

NORTHWEST CASCADE PARK & RECREATION FAC 112.68 
73056 NORTON, WORTH SUPPLY & MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT COMPUTER SERVICES 40.45 

NORTON, WORTH COMPUTER SERVICES 93.73 
NORTON, WORTH COMPUTER SERVICES 250.00 
NORTON, WORTH CENTRAL SERVICES 973.55 

73057 NORWECO INC. REPAIR DOOR-FIRE DEPT. SIDE PUBLIC SAFETY FAC-GENL 191.62 
73058 NPELRA MEMBERSHIP DUES-GUY PERSONNEL ADMINISTRATIO 200.00 
73059 NRPA MEMBERSHIP RENEWALS PARK & RECREATION FAC 360.00 
73060 OAKSTONE PUBLISHING HEALTH AWARENESS KIT PERSONNEL ADMINISTRATIO 167.26 
73061 OFFICE DEPOT CREDIT COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT­ -21.54 

OFFICE DEPOT OFFICE SUPPLIES OFFICE OPERATIONS 23.02 
OFFICE DEPOT PARK & RECREATION FAC 30.37 
OFFICE'DEPOT FINANCE-GENL 75.63 
OFFICE DEPOT CITY CLERK 75.63 
OFFICE DEPOT CITY COUNCIL 75.63 
OFFICE DEPOT PRO-SHOP 79.65 
OFFICE DEPOT PARK & RECREATION FAC 108.65 
OFFICE DEPOT UTILITY BILLING 111.37 
OFFICE DEPOT UTIL ADMIN 166.24 
OFFICE DEPOT POLICE PATROL 275.00 

73062 OLSEN, JONATHAN RENTAL DEPOSIT REFUND GENERAL FUND 100.00 
73063 PACIFIC POWER BATIER MISC. BATIERIES ER&R 264.29 
73064 PACIFIC TOPSOILS DUMP FEES WATER CAPITAL PROJECTS 121.00 

PACIFIC TOPSOILS WATER CAPITAL PROJECTS 121.00 
PACIFIC TOPSOILS WATER CAPITAL PROJECTS 176.00 

73065 PAPE MACHINERY FILTER ELEMENT ER&R 66.25 
73066 PARTS STORE, THE REAR AXLE WHEEL SEAL EQUIPMENT RENTAL 20.20 

PARTS STORE, THE SPARK PLUGS EQUIPMENT RENTAL 47.96 
PARTS STORE, THE FILTERS ER&R 55.23 
PARTS STORE, THE ER&R 56.88 
PARTS STORE, THE BATIERY W/CORE CHARGE EQUIPMENT RENTAL 104.64 
PARTS STORE, THE FILTERS ER&R 220.36 
PARTS STORE, THE BATIERIES, EQUA TORQUE ER&R 265.40 
PARTS STORE, THE FILTERS, ANTIFREEZE, ETC. ER&R 328.82 

73067 PAYDIRT, LLC TRENCH SHIELD SOURCE OF SUPPLY 97.74 
PAYDIRT, LLC SOURCE OF SUPPLY 188.42 
PAYDIRT, LLC SOURCE OF SUPPLY 445.26 
PAYDIRT, LLC SOURCE OF SUPPLY 1,803.54 

73068 PEACE OF MIND MINUTE TAKING SERVICE CITY CLERK 93.00 
PEACE OF MIND CITY CLERK 179.80 

73069 PETROCARD SYSTEMS FUEL CONSUMED STORM DRAINAGE 99.30 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS ENGR-GENL 144.95 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS BUILDING MAINTENANCE 175.86 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT­ 436.45 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS PARK & RECREATION FAC 834.04 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS GENERAL SERVICES - OVER~ 1,447.90 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS SOLID WASTE OPERATIONS 3,883.80 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS MAINT OF EQUIPMENT 5,501.80 
PETROCARD SYSTEMS POLICE PATROL 7,881.67 

r3070 PETTY CASH-COMM DEV INCREASE TO CD'S PETIY CASH FU GENERAL FUND 50.00 
73071 PLATI 7 MH 250 LITE BULBS LlBRARY-GENL 66.04 
r3072 PUBLIC FINANCE INC. LID ADMINISTRATION NON-DEPARTMENTAL 207.36 Item 3 - 6



DATE: 101712011 CITY OF MARYSVILLE PAGE: 5
TIME: 8:26: II AM INVOICE LIST 

FOR INVOICES FROM 10/6/2011 TO 10/12/2011 

CHK# VENDOR ITEM DESCRIPTION 
ACCOUNT 

DESCRIPTION 
ITEM 

AMOUNT 

73072 PUBLIC FINANCE INC. LID ADMINISTRATION ENTERPRISE DIS 298.40 

73073 PUD ACCT #2013-8099-5 PUMPING PLANT 28.32 

PUD ACCT #2021-7786-1 PUMPING PLANT 29.28 

PUD ACCT #2026-7070-9 STREET LIGHTING 53.88 

PUD ACCT #2025-7611-2 STREET LIGHTING 106.54 
PUD ACCT #2023-6819-7 PUMPING PLANT 160.06 
PUD ACCT #2033-4458-5 STREET LIGHTING 196.54 
PUD ACCT. # 2037-5304-1 MAINT OF GENL PLANT 323.36 
PUD ACCT #2001-6459-8 SOURCE OF SUPPLY 685.78 
PUD ACCT #2026-0420-3 STREET LIGHTING 1,389.37 
PUD STREET LIGHTING 1,841.74 
PUD ACCT #2025-7611-2 STREET LIGHTING 2,024.32 
PUD ACCT #2010-9896-9 PUMPING PLANT 3,231.94 

73074 PUGETSOUNDENERGY ACCT. # 549-775-373-0 MAINT OF GENL PLANT 49.90 
73075 PUGET SOUND SECURITY SUPPLIES POLICE PATROL 9.60 
73076 QUINTEL, VICKEY INSTRUCTOR SERVICES COMMUNITY CENTER 321.00 
73077 RAILROAD MANAGEMENT 8" SEWER PIPELINE CROSSING UTIL ADMIN 120.79 
73078 REVENUE, DEPT OF PAYMENT RECEIVED IN ERROR GMA REET I-EXCISE TAXES 715.51 
73079 ROBBINS, TAMARA INSTRUCTOR SERVICES COMMUNITY CENTER 448.87 
73080 RUTHERFORD,NANCY REFUND PARKS-RECREATION 50.00 
73081 SCHMIDLKOFER FAMILY PAY ESTIMATE #3 UTILITY CONSTRUCTION -2,492.50 

SCHMIDLKOFER FAMILY SEWER CAPITAL PROJECTS 54,137.10 
73082 SISKUN POWER EQUIPME CARBURETOR, GASKET, BLADE DRIV EQUIPMENT RENTAL 145.13 
73083 SMITH, SUZANNE REFUND PARKS-RECREATION 15.00 

SMITH, SUZANNE CLASS REFUND PARKS-RECREATION 30.00 
73084 SMOKEY POINT CONCRET 1 1/4" MINUS SOURCE OF SUPPLY 798.11 
73085 SNO CO TREASURER CRIME VICTIMIWITNESS FUNDS CRIME VICTIM 1,061.36 
73086 SNYDER,CANON DJ SERVICE-2012 FATHER/DAUGHTE RECREATION SERVICES 600.00 
73087 SORIANO, JOHN MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT CITY COUNCIL 20.70 
73088 SOUND SAFETY SAFETY GLASSES ER&R 2477 

SOUND SAFETY JEANS - NEWMAN, T GENERAL SERVICES - OVER~ 32.92 
SOUND SAFETY GLOVES ER&R 133.58 

73089 SPONNICK, CARRIE RENTAL DEPOSIT REFUND GENERAL FUND 100.00 
73090 SRV CONSTRUCTION HANDRAIL REPLACEMENT-INGRAHAM ROADWAY MAINTENANCE 10,317.00 
73091 STATE PATROL FINGERPRINTING SERVICES COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT­ 26.00 

STATE PATROL GENERAL FUI\JD 231.00 
73092 STEVENS, MICHAEL A. MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT CITY COUNCIL 20.76 
73093 STRATEGIES 360 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES WASTE WATER TREATMENT 1,875.00 

STRATEGIES 360 GENERAL SERVICES - MAINTI 2,250.00 
STRATEGIES 360 UTIL ADMIN 3,375.00 

73094 TETRA TECH/KCM BORE & PLACEMENT OF 2" PVC CENTRAL SERVICES 2,459.79 
73095 THYSSENKRUPP ELEVATO PREVENTATIVE MAINT-CITY HALL ADMIN FACILITIES 182.86 

THYSSENKRUPP ELEVATO PREVENTATIVE MAINT-PSB PUBLIC SAFETY FAC-GENL 182.86 
73096 TORRES, LUZ REFUND PARKS-RECREATION 15.00 
73097 TULALIP CHAMBER BEFORE BUSINESS HOURS (6) EXECUTIVE ADMIN 69.00 

TULALIP CHAMBER CITY COUNCIL 69.00 
73098 UNITED PARCEL SERVIC SHIPPING EXPENSE POLICE PATROL 223.82 
73099 VERIZON/FRONTIER ACCT. # 03 0275 1093675586 10 TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES 50.03 

VERIZON/FRONTIER ACCT. # 03 0275 1075678927 08 TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES 52.46 
VERIZON/FRONTIER ACCT. # 03 0254106542734710 MAINT OF GENL PLANT 53.73 
VERIZON/FRONTIER ACCT #POLE BLDG POLICE PATROL 53.82 
VERIZON/FRONTIER ACCT #100152074306 ADMII\J FACILITIES 107.55 

VERIZON/FRONTIER ACCT #101451140308 PUBLIC SAFETY FAC-GENL 107.55 
73100 WA PACKAGING SUPPLY OIL BURNER IGNITER EQUIPMENT RENTAL 299.76 
73101 WA SATSANG SOCIETY RENTAL DEPOSIT REFUND GENERAL FUND 100.00 
73102 WA STATE TREASURER PUBLIC SAFETY & BLDG REVENUE GENERAL FUND 958.50 

WA STATE TREASURER GENERAL FUND 61,206.14 Item 3 - 7



DATE: 10/7/2011 
TIME: 8:26:! lAM 

CHK # VENDOR 

73103 WAPRO 
73104 WASHINGTON DUPLEXES 
73105 WASTE NEWS PROFESSIO 
73106 WEED GRAAFSTRA 

WEED GRAAFSTRA 
WEED GRAAFSTRA 

WEED GRAAFSTRA 
WEED GRAAFSTRA 
WEED GRAAFSTRA 
WEED GRAAFSTRA 

73107 WHITE CAP CONSTRUCT 
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCT 
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCT 
WHITE CAP CONSTRUCT 

73108 WISEMAN, JANETTE 
73109 WRIGHT, DONNA 

WRIGHT, DONNA 
73110 WSSUA 

REASON FOR VOIDS: 

INITIATOR ERROR 

WRONG VENDOR 

CHECK LOST IN MAIL 
UNCLAIMED PROPERTY 

CITY OF MARYSVILLE
 
INVOICE LIST
 

FOR INVOICES FROM 10/6/2011 TO 10/12/2011 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

REGISTRATION-HESS 
UB 131334107003 4506120TH ST 
ANNUAL SUBSCRIPTION 
FORFEITURES-SEPT. 2011 
LEGAL FEES 

JUTE MESH
 
JUTE MATTING
 

JUTE MESH 
INSTRUCTOR SERVICES 
MILEAGE/MEAL REIMBURSEMENT 

UMPIRES 

PAGE: 6 

ACCOUNT 
DESCRIPTION 

CITY CLERK 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 

UTIL ADMIN 
POLICE INVESTIGATION 

ROADS/STREETS CONSTRue 

LEGAL-GENL 
GMA - STREET 
UTIL ADMIN 
LEGAL-GENL 

UTIL ADMIN 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 
WATER/SEWER OPERATION 
STORM DRAINAGE 
STORM DRAINAGE 
RECREATION SERVICES 
CITY COUNCIL 
CITY COUNCIL 
RECREATION SERVICES 

ITEM
 
AMOUNT
 

200.00 

123.04 
49.00 

170.00 

2,507.50 
2,686.25 
2,795.94 
5,110.00 

12,521.35 

12,521.35 
-28.87 
-14.36 
181.38 
364.59 

60.00 
20.88 
32.00 

123.00 

WARRANT TOTAL: 320,168.31 

Item 3 - 8



CITY OF MARYSVILLE AGENDA BILL 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY FOR ACTION 

CITY COUNCIL MEETING DATE: 10/24/2011 
AGENDA ITEM: 
SCADA/Telemetry Services Interlocal with the City of Duvall 

PREPARED BY: Worth Norton 

DEPARTMENT: Finance / Information Services 

DIRECTOR APPROVAL: 

ATTACHMENTS: 
Interlocal Services Agreement between the City of Duvall and the City of Marysville Concerning 
Provision of Telemetry and SCADA Services 
Supplemental Work Order between Duvall and Marysville - Telemetry and SCADA Services 
Basic Support and Maintenance 

BUDGET CODE: 40143410 and 50300090 AMOUNT: ($ 16,036.80) 

SUMMARY: 

This Interlocal provides the opportunity to share certain SCADA/Telemetry salary costs with the 
City of Duvall. In this agreement, Marysville will provide Duvall with SCADA/Telemetry 
services using the City's SCADA/Telemetry Administrator. 

SCADA (Supervisory Control and Data Acquisition) is essentially computer like systems that 
control the City's water and waste water infrastructure. Telemetry is essentially the 
communication of SCADA systems between facilities or the sending of remote instructions to a 
SCADA system. 

It has been determined that Marysville can devote up to 16 hours per month of the 
SCADA/Telemetry Administrator's time without a significant reduction in services for the 
Marysville Utilities Operations department. All services will be provided to Duvall at a mutually 
agreed upon time as to not interfere with any ongoing projects with Marysville. 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Staff recommends that Council Authorize the Mayor to sign the 
Interlocal and Supplemental Work Order to provide SCADA/Telemetry services to the City of 
Duvall. 

Item 4 - 1



lNTERLOCAL SERVICES AGREEMENT
 
BETWEEN THE CITY OF DUVALL
 
AND THE CITY OF MARYSVILLE
 

CONCERNING PROVISION OF TELEMETRY AND SCADA SERVICES
 

THIS lNTERLOCAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF DUVALL AND THE CITY OF 
MARYSVILLE CONCERNING PROVISION OF TELEMETRY AND SCADA SERVICES (this 
"Agreement") is made and entered into as of this __ day of , 20 11, by and 
between The City of Marysville, a Washington municipal corporation (Marysville), and the City of 
Duvall, a Washington municipal corporation (Duvall). 

Recitals 

WHEREAS, this Agreement is made pursuant to the authority granted by Chapter 39.34 RCW, the 
Interlocal Cooperation Act; and 

WHEREAS, Duvall requires supplemental Telemetry and SCADA (supervisory control and data 
acquisition) services; and 

WHEREAS, Marysville has employed Telemetry and SCADA professionals; and 

WHEREAS, Duvall and Marysville have similar Telemetry and SCADA systems which use similar skill 
sets to plan, manage, program, control, and use; 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the respective agreements set forth below and for other good 
and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged, Marysville 
and Duvall agree as follows 

I.	 Scope of Telemetry and SCADA Services: 

a.	 Marysville will provide Telemetry and SCADA goods and services to Duvall according to 

Supplemental Work Orders ("SWO"). Each SWO will include a description of the specific 

services to be provided, the term, and the costs of such service from quotation or from the 

published rate or fee schedule, and any other terms or conditions applicable to that service. 

The scope of Telemetry and SCADA Goods and Services to be provided under this 

Agreement are limited to the following: 

I.	 Assisting in the planning, management, control, and use of Telemetry and 

networking services for the implementation of water and waste water SCADA 

systems. 

II.	 Assisting in the planning, programming, management, control, and use of water and 

waste water PLCs (programmable logic controllers) and SCADA systems. 

111.	 Other functions as may be mutually agreeable. 

2.	 Treatment of Assets: PLC and Computer application programs and other software systems 

furnished to Duvall by Marysville are furnished on an "as is" basis with no representations or 

Intergovernmental Services Agreement between COD and COM - Page 1 of 5 

Item 4 - 2



warranties regarding use or results including any warranties of merchantability or fitness for a
 

particular purpose, unless indicated in an SWO for service.
 

Title to all property furnished by Marysville shall remain in Marysville. Title to all property 

purchased by Duvall for which Duvall is not reimbursed by Marysville shall remain in Duvall. Title 

to all property purchased by Duvall for which Duvall is reimbursed by Marysville and is used as 

component of services provided under this Agreement shall pass to and vest in Marysville upon 

completion, termination, or cancellation of the relevant SWO or this Agreement. 

Any property of Marysville furnished to Duvall shall, unless otherwise provided in this Agreement, or 

approved by Marysville, be used only for the performance of this Agreement or SWO. Duvall shall 

be responsible for any loss or damage to Marysville property that Marysville furnishes to Duvall. 

If any Marysville property is lost, destroyed, or damaged, Duvall shall immediately notify Marysville 

and shall take all reasonable steps to protect the property from further damage. 

3.	 Surrender of Property: Duvall shall surrender to Marysville all property of Marysville upon 

completion, termination, or cancellation of this Agreement. Conversely, Marysville shall surrender to 

Duvall all property of Duvall upon completion, termination, or cancellation of this Agreement. 

4.	 Time of Performance: This Agreement shall become effective upon signature by both parties and 

recording of the same with the Marysville City Clerk and the Duvall City Clerk and shall remain in 

force for a period up to five (5) years, unless terminated earlier by either party upon sixty (60) days 

written notice. 

This Agreement may be extended by mutual written agreement of Marysville Mayor, or his/her 
designee, and an authorized agent for Duvall. 

5.	 Compensation: Duvall may request an estimate or quotation of cost for proposed Telemetry and 

SCADA goods or services from Marysville. Specific agreements addressing costs, terms, schedules, 

and other factors will be described in an associated SWO developed from initial estimates or 

quotations. 

Duvall will pay Marysville for services provided hereunder and as set out in each SWO. 

SWO rate and fee schedules are subject to change at the discretion of Marysville. Rate and fee 

schedule changes shall be effective sixty (60) days after written notice of change is provided to 

Duvall, postage paid in the US mail. 

Marysville will submit an invoice, or advice of charge, to Duvall monthly, or as defined in a SWO, 

detailing charges for services rendered during the preceding month. Payment is due in full upon 

receipt of the invoice by Duvall and becomes delinquent thirty (30) days thereafter. 

A late payment fee may be applied to any remaining balance sixty (60) days after invoice. Late 

payment charges, if any, will be imposed on the unpaid balance at a rate of one percent (1.0 %) per 

month. Invoices related to SWOs with balances more than ninety (90) days past due may be 

terminated and services discontinued. Amounts disputed by Duvall under the Paragraph 7 of this 

Agreement are not subject to late payment charges. 

Intergovernmental Services Agreement between COD and COM - Page 2 of 5 

Item 4 - 3



6.	 Obligations of Duvall are as follows: As to all new Duvall acquisitions of any Telemetry and 

SCADA equipment, software or systems to be serviced by Marysville under this agreement, Duvall 

shall undertake such acquisitions in accordance with guidelines, standards or procedures established 

by Duvall and supportable by Marysville Staff. 

Payment to Marysville of all submitted invoices or advices of charge pursuant to the preceding 

section. 

7.	 Mutual Covenants: Duvall will promptly notify Marysville in writing of issues regarding invoices, 

or of services which Duvall believes do not confonn with the agreed upon tenns of this Agreement 

and/or SWO, within thirty (30) days of discovery that services are not adequate or invoice is not 

accurate, whichever occurs later. Failure to give written notice within thirty (30) days of discovery 

that services are not adequate or an invoice is not accurate constitutes waiver of any objection to 
. ..

servIces or inVOIces. 

The parties shall attempt to resolve any issues arising under this Agreement and/or any applicable 

SWO through negotiation and consultations. If that fails, the parties will seek to resolve disputes 

through the aid of a mutually selected, independent third party. All costs associated with the use of a 

third party mediator will be shared equally between Duvall and Marysville. 

This Agreement may only be modified by a written amendment effective upon execution by both 

Duvall and Marysville. An SWO may only be modified by written agreement of the parties. 

8.	 Marysville Review/Approval: Upon submittal of any request to execute a SWO or to perfonn 

optional services under any executed SWO, Marysville may, following review by Marysville, agree 

to perfonn such work or reject it, or request such modification or additions as it deems appropriate. 

9.	 Indemnification and Hold Harmless: Subject to the liability limitations stated in Paragraph 10 of 

this Agreement, Duvall shall hold hannless, indemnify, and defend, at its own expense, Marysville, 

its elected and appointed officials, officers, employees and agents, from any loss or claim for 

damages of any nature whatsoever, arising out of Duvall's perfonnance of this agreement, including 

claims by Duvall's employees or third parties, except for those losses or claims for damages solely 

caused by the negligence or willful misconduct of Marysville, its elected and appointed officials, 

officers, employees or agents. 

Subject to the liability limitations stated in Paragraph 10 of this Agreement, Marysville shall hold 

hannless, indemnify, and defend, at its own expense Duval1, its elected and appointed officials, 

officers, employees and agents, from any loss or claim for damages of any nature whatsoever, arising 

out of Marysville's perfonnance of this Agreement, including claims by Marysville employees or 

third parties, except for those losses or claims for damages solely caused by the negligence or willful 

misconduct of Duvall, its elected and appointed officials, officers, employees or agents. 

Subject to the liability limitations stated in Paragraph 10 of this Agreement, in the event of liability 

for damages of any nature whatsoever arising out of the perfonnance of this Agreement by Duvall 

and Marysville, including claims by Duvall's and Marysville's own officers, officials, employees, 

Intergovernmental Services Agreement between COD and COM - Page 3 of 5 

Item 4 - 4



agents, volunteers, or third parties, caused by or resulting from the concurrent negligence of Duvall 

and Marysville, their officers, officials, employees, agents and volunteers, each party's liability 

hereunder shall only be to the extent of that party's own negligence. 

10.	 Limitation of Liability: In no event will Marysville or Duvall be liable for any special, 

consequential, indirect, punitive or incidental damages, including but not limited to loss of data, loss 

of revenue, or loss of profits, arising out of or in connection with the performance of Marysville or 

Duvall under this Agreement or any SWO hereunder, even if Marysville or Duvall has been advised 

of the possibility of such damages. 

11.	 Compliance with Laws: Marysville and Duvall shall comply with all applicable federal, state and 

local laws, rules, and regulations in performing this contract. 

12.	 Non-assignment: Marysville and Duvall shall not assign any of the rights, duties, or obligations 

covered by this Agreement without the prior express written request and consent of each party. 

13.	 Conflicts between Attachments and Text: Should any conflicts exist between any attached exhibit 

or SWO and the text of this Agreement, the text of this Agreement shall prevail. 

14.	 Interlocal Cooperation Act (Chapter 39.34 RCW): The parties agree that no separate legal or 

administrative entities are necessary to carry out this Agreement. The parties agree that it is not 

necessary to appoint an administrator or joint board to oversee the implementation of this Agreement. 

However, should a court of a competent jurisdiction deem such an administrator or joint board 

necessary for purposes of the Interlocal Cooperation Act, Ch.39.34 RCW, an administrator or joint 

board will be established by mutual agreement of the parties. Except as expressly provided to the 

contrary in this Agreement, any real or personal property used or acquired by either party in 

connection with the performance of this Agreement will remain the sole property of such party, and 

the other party shall have no interest therein. 

15.	 Governing Law and Venue: This agreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of 

Washington and any lawsuit regarding this contract must be brought in the Snohomish County 

Superior Court, Everett, Washington. 

16.	 Severability: Should any clause, phrase, sentence or paragraph of this agreement be declared invalid 

or void, the remaining provisions of this Agreement shall remain in full force and effect. 

17.	 Recording: The parties shall file this Agreement with Duvall City Clerk, Marysville City Clerk, and 

the Snohomish County Auditor or, alternatively, listed by subject on a public agency's web site or 

other electronically retrievable public source pursuant to RCW 39.34.040. 

18.	 Notices: All required notices to be given under this Agreement shall be delivered to the 

Administrative Contacts at the addresses listed below. Notices sent by registered mail shall be 

deemed served when deposited in the U.S. mail. 

City of Duvall City of Marysville 

Public Works Department Information Services Department 

14525 Main Street NE 1049 State Avenue 

Intergovernmental Services Agreement between COD and COM - Page 4 of 5 

Item 4 - 5



------------

------------

-----------

-----------

Duvall, WA 98019 Marysville, WA 98270 

Attn: Boyd Benson, PE, LEG, City Engineer Attn: Worth Norton, I.S. Manager 

IN WITNESS THEREOF, the Parties hereto have executed this Agreement on the day of 

________, 2011. 

CITY OF DUVALL 

Willlbershof, Mayor 

Date: 

Approved as to Form: 

City Attorney 

Date: 

Attest: 

City Clerk 

CITY OF MARYSVILLE
 

Jon Nehring, Mayor 

Date: 

Approved as to Form: 

Grant K. Weed, City Attorney 

Date: 

Attest: 

April O'Brien, Deputy City Clerk 

Intergovernmental Services Agreement between COD and COM - Page 5 of 5 

Item 4 - 6



Supplemental Work Order between Duvall and Marysville
 
Telemetry and SCADA Services Basic Support and Maintenance
 

This Supplemental Work Order (SWO) is executed by the City of Duvall, a municipal corporation of the 
State of Washington (Duvall) and the City of Marysville, a municipal corporation of the State of 
Washington (Marysville) pursuant to the tenns and conditions of the Interlocal Services Agreement 
between the City of Duvall and the City of Marysville Concerning Provisioning of Telemetry and 
SCADA Services signed on (ISA). The parties acknowledge they have 
read and understand the tenns and conditions-therein. All rights and obligations of the parties shall be 
subject to and governed by the tenns of the ISA. This SWO sets forth the obligations of the parties with 
respect to Marysville's provision of services to Duvall. 

1. Scope of Work 

Technical support and monthly preventative maintenance services shall be perfonned by Marysville for 
Duvall's Telemetry and SCADA Systems. 

Services shall include: 

I)	 SCADA System Evaluation and Upgrades 
a.	 Four (4) days of 6.75 hours on-site and 1.25 hours in travel per month. 
b.	 This work is to be perfonned at Duvall's Public Works facility and SCADA locations 

within the City. 
c.	 This work is to be perfonned by Marysville's SCADA/Telemetry Administrator. 
d.	 Marysville will coordinate with Duvall to ensure site visits are made at a convenient 

time for both Marysville and Duvall.
 
2) Monthly On-Site Preventative Maintenance
 

a.	 One (l) day or 6.75 hours on-site and 1.25 hours in travel per month. 
b.	 This work is to be perfonned at Duvall's Public Works facility or SCADA locations 

within the City. 
c.	 This work is to be perfonned by Marysville's SCADA/Telemetry Administrator. 
d.	 Marysville will coordinate with Duvall to ensure site visits are made at a convenient 

time for both Marysville and Duvall.
 
3) Optional Technical Support
 

a.	 Up to eight (8) hours per month for unplanned events, such as hardware failures, or 
new alanning or reporting requirements. 

b.	 Optional support is provided during the hours of 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM, Monday 
through Thursday.
 

4) Optional After Hours Support
 
a.	 For non-business hour emergencies, Marysville will make every reasonable effort to 

respond within twenty four (24) hours of notification of an emergency problem. 
b.	 Marysville cannot guarantee the on-call status of any of Marysville's personnel and 

shall not be held responsible for delays caused by factors beyond Marysville's 
control. 

2. Term and Termination 

The tenn of this SWO is effective upon the date of execution by both parties for the period of two (2) 
years unless extended or terminated upon written notification to the other party. Either party may cancel 

Supplemental Work Order #1 between DUV ALL and MARYSVILLE - Page 1 of 4 

Item 4 - 7



or tenninate this SWO upon sixty (60) day's written notification to the other party. In the event the ISA is 
tenninated, this SWO shall also tenninate on the ISA tennination date. 

3. Liability 

Neither party shall be liable to the other for claims, actions or damages, including direct, consequential, 
special or otherwise, for failure to comply with the tenns and conditions of this SWO. 

4. Designated Points of Contact and Escalation Points. 

Marysville's designated point of contact for Duvall to request SCADA or Telemetry Support Services: 

Roy Alderman, SCADNTelemetry Administrator 
1049 State Avenue 
Marysville, WA 98270 
Desk: (360) 363- 8172 
raldennan@marysvillewa.gov 

Marysville's designated point of contact for Administrative, Billing, and Support Escalation: 

Worth Norton, Infonnation Services Manager
 
1049 State Avenue
 
Marysville, WA 98270
 
Desk: (360) 363- 8029
 
wnorton@marysviIJewa.gov
 

Duvall's designated point of contact for Marysville to send invoices, address issues, and otherwise 
conduct business shall be: 

City of Duvall 
Public Works Department 
14525 Main Street NE 
Duvall, WA98019 
Attention Mike Fisher (Public Works Superintendent) or Boyd E. Benson (City Engineer) 

5. Acceptance of Work 

Marysville will invoice Duvall for all work on a monthly basis. Payment of invoices will indicate to 
Marysville acceptance of work and services perfonned for Duvall. 

6. Equipment 

NO equipment is provided by this SWO. 

7. Pricing and Service Fees 

Hourly Labor Rates are calculated to include employee benefits and salary based on actual working hours. 
Rates also include employee and departmental overhead. 

Standard Business Hour Labor Rates 
SCADNTelemetry Administrator $ 77.10 

Supplemental Work Order # I between DUVALL and MARYSVILLE - Page 2 of 4 

Item 4 - 8



Network Administrator $ 73.44
 
Engineering Technician $ 69.93
 

Afterhours Labor Rates: Due to contracts and agreements currently in place with Marysville employees, 
there will be a three hour minimum charge for any after hour support call. Work done in excess of three 
hours will be at the afterhours' hourly rate. 

Afterhours Labor Rates Minimum Hourly 
SCADNTelemetry Administrator $ 346.95 $ 115.65 
Network Administrator $ 330.50 $110.17 

Expenses will be billed at actual cost plus 10% to cover administration and overhead. Mileage will be 
calculated at the current IRS rate plus 10% to cover administration and overhead. If Marysville recalls 
any staff while onsite at Duvall to handle an emergency situation at Marysville, Marysville will not 
charge Duval travel mileage for any subsequent visit to make up the time lost due to the recall. 

Standard Travel Measurements from Marysville to Duvall 
Mileage - Roundtrip 61.4 Miles 
Travel time - Roundtrip 1.25 Hours 

8. Billing and Invoicing 
Billing and invoicing will be in accordance with procedures outlined in the ISA. Customer will be billed 
monthly for services rendered. Customer will be billed in full for services rendered up to and including 
the date Marysvil1e receives Duvall's cancellation or change request. 

9. Modifications / Changes 
This SWO may be modified at any time upon mutual written agreement of the parties. All such 
modifications will be made as an amendment to this SWO and will take precedence over the original 
SWo. 

10. Assignment 
This SWO may not be assigned by either party to a third party without the prior written consent of Duvall 
and Marysville. 

Notices: All required notices to be given under this Agreement shall be delivered to the Administrative 
Contacts at the addresses listed below. Notices sent by registered mail shall be deemed served when 
deposited in the U.S. mail. 

City of Duvall City of Marysville 

Public Works Department Information Services Department 

14525 Main Street NE 1049 State Avenue 

Duvall, WA 98019 Marysville, WA 98270 

Attn: Steve Leniszewski, PE, PW Director Attn: Worth Norton, l.S. Manager 

Supplemental Work Order #1 between DUVALL and MARYSVILLE - Page 3 of 4 

Item 4 - 9



------------ -----------

CITY OF Duvall CITY OF Marysville 

Will Ibershof, Mayor Jon Nehring, Mayor 

Date: Date: 

Supplemental Work Order # J between DUVALL and MARYSVILLE - Page 4 of 4 

Item 4 - 10



CITY OF MARYSVILLE 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY FOR ACTION 

CITY COUNCIL MEETING DATE: October 24,2011 
AGENDA ITEM: Hotel Motel Committee Recommendation 

PREPARED BY: 
Gloria Hirashima, Chief Administrative Officer 

AGENDA SECTION: 
New Business 

AGENDA NUMBER: 

ATTACHMENTS 
1. Hotel/Motel Committee Recommendation 
2. Hotel/Motel Committee Scoring 

APPROVED BY: k­
( ) 

MAYOR I CAO 

BUDGET CODE: AMOUNT: 

The Hotel/Motel Committee convened on October 10, 2011 to review grant applications. The 
committee interviewed grant applicants and then scored all proposals. Funding available through 
2012 is $140,000. The committee recommended award of $133,418.23 to the grant applicants. 

The committee recommends the following funcling for projects: 

City of Marysville Cedarcrest Golf Course- Holiday Lighting Tour 

Maryfest Strawberry Festival- "Berrywood" 80th Annual Festival 

City of Marysville - Chamber of Commerce Visitor Info Center 

MPHS Band- Color My World Band Uniforms 

Greater Marysville Chamber of Commerce-Maps & Tech Update 

Marysville H.istorical Society- Map restoration and preservation 

Marysville YMCA- Three-Sixty Breakdancing Competition 

City of Marysville Police Department - Special Event funcling 

City of Marysville- Marysville/North Snohomish County Visitor's Guide 

City of Marysville Streets Division- Strawberry Festival funding 

City of Marysville Solid \'\/aste Division - Strawberry Festival funcling 

Marysville Kiwanis Club - State Avenue Streetscape Power receptacles 

$ 4,500.00 

$20,000.00 

$30,000.00 

$30,000.00 

$ 8,155.00 

$ 6,434.00 

$ 2,500.00 

$12,173.45 

$ 5,910.00 

$ 8,447.84 

$ 3,297.94 

$ 2,000.00 

RECOMJvfENDED ACTION: 
funding. 

Approve Hotel/Motel Committee Recommendation to award 

COUNCIL ACTION: 

Item 5 - 1



EXECUTIVE DEPARTMENT 
1049 State Avenue • Marysville, WA 98270 

(360) 363-8000 • (360) 363-8040 FAX 

MEMORANDUM 

DATE: October 12, 2011 

TO: 

FROM: 

City Council 

Gloria Hirashima, Chief Executive Officer rJ".­
RE: Hotel/Motel Committee Recommendation 

Pursuant to RCW 67.28.180, the City imposes a hotel-motel tax that may be used for the 
following activities: 

1) Tourism Promotion 
2) Acquisition of tourism-related facilities, 
3) Operation of tourism-related facilities (includes non-profit facilities) 

As required by state law, the City has formed a lodging tax advisory committee to review 
and make recommendations on use of hotel-motel tax proceeds. 

The City advertised for the 2011 grant period in August 2011 and accepted applications 
between August 8 and September 5, 2011. The committee convened on October 10, 2011 
and interviewed all grant applicants. All grant applicants made presentations on their 
submitted proposal. The committee scored all applications and made a recommendation to 
City Council. 

The Committee scored and ranked all projects. Following scoring and ranking, the 
committee discussed the funding requests to determine how the funds would be allocated 
amongst the projects. The committee was advised that there would be $140,000 to allocate 
for 2011-2012. There was $236,758.23 in grant requests, so approximately $97,000 
needed to be cut from the submitted proposals. The committee felt all projects were 
deserving and would proVide benefit to the community. While the City of Marysville spray 
park received a high ranking (#3 out of 13 applications), the committee felt that the benefit 
was primarily to the local community and might not generate outside tourism. They also 
felt that award of the request for $93,340 would result in multiple smaller projects not 
receiving funding. As a result they recommended full funding for all other projects, and did 
not recommend funding for the spray park. 

The committee recommends funding for $133,418.23 in lodging funds for the 2011-2012 
grant period. 

Item 5 - 2



2011 Hotel Motel Grant Request Scores 

Name of Organization Contact Name Project Name 

lee 
Phillips, 
Council 

Mary Kirkland, 
Downtown 
Merchants 
Assoc 

55 

Maryfest 
Carol 
Kapua 

48 

Barbaba 
Brotherton 
Marysville 
Chamber 

Andy Tift 
Holiday 
Inn 
Express 

Mr. lee 
Village 
Hotel 

City 
Center 
Hotel 

Score 
Total 

Request 
Amount 

Hotel/Motel 
Committee 
Recommendatio 
n Amount 

Amount 
Council 
Approved 

Contract 
Mailed/ 
Received 

Scalable 
Project 

Proof of Non 
Profit Status 

City of Marysville, 

Cedarcrest Golf 

Course 

Jim Ballew, 6915 

Armar Rd, 

Marysvylle, WA 

98270; 

360.652.6070 hm 

360.363.8400 wk 

Holiday Lighting 

Tour 46 55 52 38 N/A 294 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 

Received 
8/5/11 Y (6) 

N/A (4); 

Y (2) 

Maryfest, Inc dba 

Marysville Strawberry 

Festival 

Angie Miller, PO 

Box 855 Marysville, 

98270; 

425.232.0274cell 

360.435.2253hm 

360.659.7664wk 

"Berrywood" 80th 

Annual Strawberry 

Festival 51 45 40 48 35 48 N/A 267 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 

Received 
8/5/11 Y (6) Y (6) 

City of Marysville, 

Parks Department 

Jim tsallew, b~l21 

Armar Rd, 

Marysville, WA 

98270; 

360.363.8400 wk 

Ebey Waterfront 

Spray Park 50 50 43 52 33 38 N/A 266 $93,340.00 $0.00 

Received 
8/5/11 Y (6) 

N/A (5); 

Y (1) 

City of Marysville 

~anay Langaon, 

1049 State Ave, 

Marysville, WA 

98270; 

360.363.8017 

City of Marysville 

Visitor/Tourism 

Support 45 46 27 48 45 37 N/A 248 $40,000.00 $30,000.00 

Received 
8/5/11 

Y (5); 

N/? (1) 

N/A (5); 

Y (1) 

Marysville Pilchuck 

High School Band 

John Rants, 5611 

108th St NE, 

Marysville, Wa 

98271; 

425.346.3298 hm 

360.657.6138 wk Color My World 34 36 44 54 47 31 N/A 246 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 

Received 
8/3/11 Y (6) 

Y (3); 

N/A (2); 

N(1) 

Shared Hotel Motel Folder 
Item 5 - 3



2011 Hotel Motel Grant Request Scores 

Greater Marysville 

Tulalip Chamber of 

Commerce 

Caldie Rogers, 

8825 34th Ave NE, 

Ste C, Marysville, 

WA 98271 

Washington State 
Road Map/Greater 
Marysville Tulalip 
Chamber of 
Commerce & Visitor 
Information Center 
Tech Update 44 38 23 55 40 36 N/A 236 $8,155.00 $8,155.00 

Received 
8/2/11 Y(6) 

Y (5); 

N/A (1) 

Marysville Historical 

Society 

Ken Cage, PO Box 

41, Marysville, WA 

98270; 

360.659.5808 hm 

360.659.3090 wk 

Historic Marysville 

Map Restoration & 

Preservation 42 23 50 47 38 34 N/A 234 $6,434.00 $6,434.00 
Received 
8/5/11 Y(6) 

Y (5); 

N/A (1) 

Marysville YMCA 

Reeshemah Davis, 

Executive Director, 

6420 60th Dr NE, 

Marysville, WA 

98270 

YMCA Three-Sixty 

Breakdancing 

Competition 45 34 45 35 31 42 N/A 232 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 
Received 
8/5/11 Y(6) Y (6) 

,v,a'5a ,c, 

Vanderwalker, 

1635 Grove St, 

City of Marysville, 

Police Department 

Marysville, WA 

98270; 

360.363.8308 

Police Employees 

Work Special 

Events 37 31 55 35 23 34 N/A 215 $12,173.45 $12,173.45 
Received 
8/3/11 Y(6) 

N/A (4); 

Y(2) 

City of Marysville 

Doug Buell, Comm 

Info Officer, 1049 

State Ave, 

Marysville, WA 

98270; 

360.363.8086 wk 

360.651.0633 hm 

2012-13 

Marysvi lie/North 

Snohomish County 

Visitors Guide 33 27 55 31 24 25 N/A 195 $5,910.00 $5,910.00 
Received 

8/5/11 

Y (5); 

N (1) 

N/A (5); 

Y(1) 

Shared Hotel Motel Folder 2011 Hotel Motel Grant Request Scores Item 5 - 4



2011 Hotel Motel Grant Request Scores 

City of Marysville, 

Streets Division 

ILnarlie tsurKe, ~u 

Columbia Ave, 

Marysville, WA 

98270; 

360.363.8260 Strawberry Festival 27 43 35 28 17 39 N/A 189 $8,447.84 $8,447.84 
Received 
7/22/11 Y (6) 

N/A (4); 

Y (2) 

City of Marysville, 

Solid Waste Division 

ILarry Larson, ~u 

Columbia, 

Marysville, WA 

98270; 

360.363.8119 Strawberry Festival 25 34 32 32 17 36 N/A 176 $3,297.94 $3,297.94 
Received 
7/22/11 Y (6) 

N/A (4); 

Y (2) 

Dan Steffen, 

Marysville Kiwanis 

Club 

President, PO Box 

101, Marysville, 

WA 98270; 

360.658.0400 hm 

State Ave 

Streetscape Power 

Receptacles Repair 

& Replace 31 30 30 27 9 32 N/A 159 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 
Received 
8/5/11 

Y (5); 

N (1) 

Y (3); 

N (2); 

N/A (1) 

Total $236,758.23 $133,418.23 $0.00 

2011 Hotel Motel Grant Request Scores Shared Hotel Motel Folder 
Item 5 - 5



CITY OF MARYSVILLE 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY FOR ACTION 

CITY COUNCIL MEETING DATE: 10-24-2011 
AGENDA ITEM: 
Adoption 2009 International Fire Code (IFC) 

AGENDA SECTION: 
New Business 

PREPARED BY: 
Thomas J. Maloney, Fire Marshal 

APPROVED BY: 
Greg Com, Fire Chief 

AITACHMENTS: 
1. Summary of 2009 International Code Adoption 
2. Proposed amendments to MMC 9.04 
3. Proposed Ordinance for 2009 International Fire Code 

MAYOR ICAO 

BUDGET CODE: AMOUNT: 

DESCRIPTION: 

The State of Washington Building Code Council adopted the 2009 International Building 
Codes effective July 1, 2010. Local jurisdictions including Marysville are required to 
adopt any local amendments. 

Proposal to amend and adopted the Marysville Municipal Code Title 9 - Fire Code. 

In an effort to improve the ease of use and to align with the International Fire Code Title 
9 has been renumbered to reflect sequential order of the fire code. In addition, a new 
section is being requested for adoption regarding the installation of solar photovoltaic 
power systems (solar panels). A proposal to add residential fire sprinklers to one and two 
family dwelling units three (3) or more stories is also included for review. 

Fire Prevention Division staff have been trained in the 2009 IFC and State of Washington 
Amendments. 

The attached exhibits include general information on the International Code Council 
(ICC) and the proposed changes. The draft ordinance includes minor revisions and they 
are noted in the attachments. 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Authorize the Mayor to sign the ordinance 
COUNCIL ACTION: 

Item 6 - 1



City of Marysville-Fire
 
2009 INTERNATIONAL FIRECODE ADOPTION
 

The City of Marysville in conjunction with the State of Washington has been implementing the 
International Codes suite since July 2004. Every three (3) years the International Code Council 
(ICC) updates and adopts new editions of all the International Codes. The city, along with the 
state has been enforcing the 2009 International Fire Code (lFC) since July 1, 2010. With this 
proposal there are only minor changes to Chapter 9 of Marysville Municipal Code (MMC). The 
following is a brief history of the past code merging process. 

Origin of ICC 
The International Code Council (ICC) was established in 1994. It is a nonprofit organization 
dedicated to developing a single set of comprehensive and coordinated national model 
construction codes. The founders of the ICC are the Building Officials and Code Administrators 
International, Inc. (BOCA), International Conference of Building Officials (lCBO), and Southern 
Building Code Congress International, Inc. (SBCCI). Since the early 1990's, these nonprofit 
organizations developed three separate sets of model codes used throughout the United States. 
Although such regional code development was effective during the time, a global marketplace 
and teclmological advances in construction made a single set of codes a practical necessity. The 
nation's three model code groups responded to this need by creating the International Code 
Council and by developing codes without regional limitations - the International Codes. On 
February 1,2003, The ICC became one consolidated organization, incorporating the staff and 
services of the three founding organizations. 

The first edition of the International Fire Code (2000) was the culmination of an effort initiated 
in 1997 by a development committee appointed by ICC and consisting of representatives of the 
three statutory members of the International Code Council: Building Officials and Code 
Administrators International, Inc. (BOCA), International Conference of Building Officials 
(lCBO) and Southern Building Code Congress International (SBCCI). The intent was to draft a 
comprehensive set of fire safety regulations consistent with and inclusive of the scope of the 
existing model codes. Technical content of the latest model codes promulgated by BOCA, ICBO 
and SBCCI was utilized as the basis for the development, followed by public hearings in 1998 
and 1999 to consider proposed changes. This 2009 edition presents the code as originally issued, 
with changes reflected in the 2006 edition and further changes approved through the ICC Code 
Development Process through 2008. A new edition such as this is promulgated every three years. 

The IFC is a model code that regulates minimum fire safety requirements for new and existing 
buildings, facilities, storage and processes. The IFC addresses fire prevention, fire protection, life 
safety and safe storage and use of hazardous materials in new and existing buildings, facilities 
and processes. The IFC provides a total approach of controlling hazards in all buildings and sites, 
regardless of the hazard being indoors or outdoors. 

FIRE EXHIBIT 2 SUMMARY SHEET IFC 2009 IO 24 II.DOC 

Item 6 - 2



Washington State International Code Suite: 
~ International Building Code, Standards and amendments - WAC 51-50 
~ International Residential, Standards and amendments - WAC 51-52 
~ International Mechanical, Standards and amendments - WAC 51-52 
~ International Fire Code, Standards and amendments - WAC 51-54 
~ Uniform Plumbing Code, Standards and amendments - WAC 51-56, 51-57 
~ Washington State Energy Code, Standards and amendments -WAC 51-1 
~ Washington State Barrier-Free Code Chapter 11- Standards WAC 51-13 

Proposed Changes to the MMC: 
The changes listed below are included within the proposed code that is attached for Council 
consideration. Included are some of the major revisions to the 2009 MMC. This proposed code 
also assists builders, business, and property owners in better understanding the fire code 
language, requirements, and inspections. 

Proposed Changes: 
~ The fire code has been re-numbered to correspond with IFC. Currently, the MMC 

amendments are not in consecutive order. 

~	 Proposed solar panel code information this has been reviewed by Silicon Energy, a 
business that has recently moved to their new location here in Marysville. 

~	 Proposed change to the residential sprinkler to include three (3) or more stories. 

~	 Appendix F-Hazard Ranking: The information in this appendix is intended to be a 
companion to the specific requirements of Chapters 28 through 44 which regulate the 
storage, handling and use of all hazardous materials classified as either physical or health 
hazards. These materials pose diverse hazards, including instability, reactivity, and 
flammability, oxidizing potential or toxicity; therefore, identifying them by hazard 
ranking is essential. This appendix lists the various hazardous materials categories that 
are defined in the code, along with the NFPA 704 hazard ranking for each. Note that the 
provisions contained in this appendix are not mandatory unless specifically referenced in 
the adopting ordinance. 

~	 Appendix H-Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and Hazardous Materials 
Inventory Statement (HMIS) Instructions: This new IFC appendix is intended to assist 
businesses in establishing a Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and 
Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS) based on the classification and 
quantities of materials that would be found on site in storage and/or use. The sample 
forms and available Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) provide the basis for the 
evaluations. It is also a companion to IFC Sections 407.5 and 407.6 which provide the 
requirement that the HMIS and HMMP be submitted when required by the fire code 
official. Note that the provisions contained in this appendix are not mandatory unless 
specifically referenced in the adopting ordinance. 

FIRE EXHIBIT 2 SUMMARY SHEET IFC 20091024 Il.DOC 

Item 6 - 3



~	 Appendix-I Fire Protection Systems-Unsafe Conditions: The purpose of this new IFC 
appendix, which was developed by the ICC Hazard Abatement in Existing Buildings 
Committee, is to provide the fire code official with a list of conditions that are readily 
identifiable by the inspector during the course of an inspection utilizing the International 
Fire Code. The specific conditions identified in this appendix are primarily derived from 
applicable NFPA standards and pose a hazard to the proper operation of the respective 
systems. While these do not represent all of the conditions that pose a hazard or otherwise 
may impair the proper operation of fire protection systems, their identification in this 
adoptable appendix will provide a more direct path for enforcement by the fire code 
official. Note that the provisions contained in this appendix are not mandatory unless 
specifically referenced in the adopting ordinance. 

~	 Appendix J-Emergency Responder Radio Coverage: This new IFC Appendix provides 
design, installation, testing and maintenance requirements for the emergency responder 
communications facilities where required by new IFC Section 510. Included are 
requirements for system performance, primary and secondary power supplies, signal 
boosters, radio frequencies, installer qualifications, and acceptance testing and system 
maintenance. Note that the provisions contained in this appendix are not mandatory 
unless specifically referenced in the adopting ordinance. 

Staff Training and Education for the New Code: 
The Fire Prevention staff have attended seminars, and initiated training to study and become 
familiar with the new code sections and provisions. This includes the recent Washington State 
amendments published by Washington State Building Code Council. Staff continues to receive 
ongoing training, and one staff member has presented regional updates on the changes to the new 
IFC. 

Recap to the Updates to the International Codes 
The IFC is kept up-to-date through the review of proposed changes submitted by code enforcing 
officials, industry representatives, design professionals and other interested parties. Proposed 
changes are carefully considered through an open code development process in which all 
interested and affected parties may participate. 

The 2009 IFC format continues to be consistent with the previous editions of the IFC. New or 
revised sections are clearly high-lighted by black markings in the margins of each book, which is 
helpful to all parties using the books. 

FIRE EXHIBIT 2 SUMMARY SHEET IFC 2009 10 24 II.DOC 

Item 6 - 4



t 

CITY OF MARYSVILLE
 
Marysville, Washington
 

ORDINANCE NO. _
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARYSVILLE REPEALING AND 
REPLACING PORTIONS OF ORDINANCES NO. 2739, NO. 2532, AND 
NO. 2378 CODIFIED IN MARYSVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE CHAPTER 
9.04; AND ADOPTING A REVISED AND UPDATED MARYSVILLE 
MUNICIPAL CODE CHAPTER 9.04 ENTITLED "FIRE CODE"; AND 
PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY. 

WHEREAS, the City desires to revise and update the Marysville Municipal Code (MMC) 
Chapter 9.04 entitled "Fire Code" to the 2009 International Fire Code and to have MMC 
section numbers consistent with the International Fire Code, the City repeals Chapter 
9.04 and adopts a new Chapter 9.04 entitled "Fire Code." 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MARYSVILLE, 
WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. Repeal. Portions of Ordinances No. 2739, No. 2532, and No. 2378 codified in 
Marysville Municipal Code Chapter 9.04 entitled "Fire Code" are hereby repealed. 

Section 2. Adopt. A New Marysville Municipal Code Chapter 9.04 entitled "Fire Code" 
is hereby adopted to be codified to read as follows: 

Chapter 9.04 
FIRE CODE 

Sections: 
9.04.0010 Adoption by reference. 
9.04.0020 Establishment and duties of bureau of fire prevention. 
9.04.0030 Definitions. 
9.04.0040 Flammable or combustible liquid storage limits 
9.04.0070 Additional amendments to International Fire Code. 
9.04.0101 International Fire Code Appendices Adopted 
9.04.0105 International Fire Code Section 105 Pennits is amended. 

New Section 105.7.15 added - Solar photovoltaic power systems 
9.04.0109.3 Violation Penalties - Amended International Fire Code Section 109.3 
9.04.0109.4 Section 109.4 - Excessive False Alanns, Penalty Imposed 
9.04.0503 Additional sections of International Fire Code Section 503 adopted - Fire 

Apparatus Access Roads. 
9.04.0503.1.4 Section 503.1.4 added - Aerial Fire Apparatus Access Roads. 
9.04.0503.1.5 Section 503.1.5 added - One- or Two-Family Dwelling Residential 

Developments. 
9.04.0503.2 International Fire Code Section 503.2 amended - Access - Specifications: 

ORDINANCE Page 1 of 14 
glmv/MV-II-021I1FC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-1' F 

Item 6 - 5



9.04.0503.2.3 International Fire Code Section 503.2.3 amended - Access - Surfacing. 
9.04.0503.2.4 International Fire Code Section 503.2.4 amended - Access - Turning radius. 
9.04.0503.2.5 International Fire Code Section 503.2.5 amended - Access - Turnarounds. 
9.04.0503.2.7 International Fire Code Section 503.2.7 amended - Access - Gradients. 
9.04.0503.5 International Fire Code Section 503.5 amended - Required gates or 

barricades. 
9.04.0503.6 International Fire Code Section 503.6 amended - Gates accessing residential 

developments. 
9.04.0503.7 International Fire Code new Section 503.7 added - Split entries. 
9.04.0505 International Fire Code Section 505.1 Address identification is amended. 
9.04.0507.3 International Fire Code Section 507.3 Fire flow is amended. 
9.04.077.1 International Fire Code Section 511 added. 
9.04.0507.5 International Fire Code Section 507.5.1 fire hydrant location is not adopted. 
9.04.0601 International Fire Code Section 601.2 Permits is amended. Solar photovoltaic 

power systems permit is added. 
9.04.0602 International Fire Code Section 602.1 Definitions is amended added 

definition - Power tap. 
9.04.0605 New International Fire Code Section 605 Electrical equipment is amended. 
9.04.0902 International Fire Code Section 902.1 Definitions is amended. 
9.04.0903 International Fire Code Section 903.2 amended - Sprinkler systems - Where 

required 
9.04.0903.2.1 International Fire Code Section 903.2.1 amended - Sprinkler systems­

Group A occupancies. 
9.04.0903.2.3 International Fire Code Section 903.2.3 amended - Sprinkler systems­

Group E occupancies. 
9.04.0903.2.4 International Fire Code Section 903.2.4 amended - Sprinkler systems­

Group F-1 occupancies. 
9.04.0903.2.7 International Fire Code Section 903.2.7 amended - Sprinkler systems­

Group M and B occupancies. 
9.04.0903.2.8 International Fire Code Section 903.2.8 amended - Sprinkler systems­

Group R occupancies. 
9.04.0903.2.9 International Fire Code Section 903.2.9 and 903.2.10 amended - Sprinkler 

systems - Group S occupancies. 

9.04.0010 Adoption by reference. 
Certain documents, copies of which are on file in the office of the clerk of the city of Marysville, 
entitled "International Fire Code, 200~6-Edition," CIFC) published by the International Code 
Council, with amendments as adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council are 
adopted as the fire code of the city of Marysville (hereinafter sometimes referred to as the "fire 
code") for the purpose of prescribing regulations for the safeguarding of life and property from 
the hazards of fire and explosion. Except as otherwise specifically amended herein, or by later 
ordinance, each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said 
code and standards are incorporated and made part of this chapter as if fully set forth herein. 
(Formerly 9.04.010, Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 1,2004; Ord. 2378 § 1,200 I). 

ORDINANCE Page 2 of 14 
glmv!MV-J 1-021 /IFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 6



9.04.0020 Establishment and duties of bureau of fire prevention. 
(1) The International Fire Code shall be enforced by the bureau of fire prevention in the fire
 
department of Marysville which is established and which shall be operated under the supervision
 
of the chief of the fire department.
 
(2) The fire marshal in charge of the bureau of fire prevention shall be the chief of the fire
 
department of Marysville, or any qualified person designated by the chief.
 
(3) The chief of the fire department may detail such members of the fire department as inspectors
 
as shall from time to time be necessary.
 
(Formerly 9.04.020; Ord. 2739 § 1, 2008; Ord. 2532 § 2, 2004; Ord. 850 § 2, 1975).
 

9.04.0030 Definitions. 
(1) Wherever the word "jurisdiction" is used in the International Fire Code, it means the city of
 
Marysville.
 
(2) "Commercial occupancy" means groups A, B, E, H, F, I (except adult family homes as
 
defined in Chapter 70.128 RCW), M, R-1, R-2, R-4 and S occupancies as defined in Section 202
 
- Occupancy Classifications of the International Fire Code 20026-Edition.
 
(Formerly 9.04.030; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 3,2004; Ord. 2378 § 2, 2001; Ord. 850 §
 
3, 1975).
 

9.04.0040 Flammable or combustible liquid storage limits.
 
The storage of Class I, II and III-A liquids in aboveground tanks exceeding 26,000 gallons
 
individual or 78,000 gallons aggregate capacity is prohibited within the corporate limits of the
 
city of Marysville. Storage shall be limited to horizontal-tanks only. This language shall replace
 
the language of International Fire Code Sections 3404.2.9.Q.~.1 and 3406.2.4.4.
 
(Formerly 9.04.040; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 4, 2004; Ord. 2378 § 3,200 I; Ord. 1373 §
 
2, 1984; Ord. 1082 § 2, 1979; Ord. 850 § 4, 1975).
 

9.04.0070 Additional amendments to the International Fire Code.
 
The additional amendments to the fire code in MMC 9.04.0101 9.04.071 through 9.04.0903.2.9
 
9.04.087 are enacted. 
(Formerly 9.04.070; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6, 2001). 

9.04.0101 International Fire Appendices Adopted.
 
These appendices of the International Fire Code are hereby adopted: B, F, H, 1, and J .
 
(Formerly 9.04.087 Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6,2001).
 

9.04.0105 International Fire Code Section 105 Permits is amended. New Section 105.7.15 
added - Solar photovoltaic power systems. 
105.7.15 Solar photovoltaic power systems. A construction permit is required to install or modify 
solar photovoltaic power systems. 

9.04.0109.3 Violation Penalties - Amended International Fire Code Section 109.3 
(1) Any person who violates any of the provisions of this code as adopted or fails to comply 
therewith, or who violates or fails to comply with any order made under this code, or who builds 
in violation of any detailed statement of specifications or plans submitted and approved 

ORDINANCE Page 3 of 14 
g!mvIMV-II-021/IFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 7



thereunder, or any certificate or permit issued thereunder, and from which no appeal has been 
taken, or who fails to comply with such an order as affirmed or modified by the chief or by a 
court of competent jurisdiction within the time fixed in this chapter is severally, for each and 
every such violation and noncompliance respectively, guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a 
fine of not more than $300.00 $.L.QOO.OO or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or by 
both such fine and imprisonment. The imposition of one penalty for any violation shall not 
excuse the violation or permit it to continue; and all such persons shall be required to correct or 
remedy such violations or defects within a reason-able time; and when not otherwise specified, 
each 10 days that prohibited conditions are maintained constitutes a separate offense. 
(2) The application of the penalties herein described shall not be held to prevent the enforced
 
removal of prohibited conditions.
 
(Formerly 9.04.100; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 10,2004; Ord. 850 § 10, 1975).
 

9.04.0109.4 Section 109.4 - Excessive False Alarms, Penalty Imposed.
 
No more than three false alarms from any location shall be permitted within any calendar year.
 
The owner or operator of any location from which more than three false alarms are sent within
 
any calendar year shall be subject to the imposition of a criminal penalty pursuant to MMC
 
9.04.0109.3 9.04.100.
 
(Formerly 9.04.095; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 9, 2003).
 

9.04.0503 Additional sections of International Fire Code Section 503 adopted - Fire
 
Apparatus Access Roads.
 
Section 503.1 shall be adopted as written, Sections 503.1.1, 503.1.2, 503.1.3, 503.2, 503.3, and
 
503.4, being sections of the International Fire Code (20026 Edition) not adopted by the
 
Washington State Building Code Council, are hereby adopted and enacted in the city of
 
Marysville.
 
(Formerly 9.04.071; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6, 2001).
 

9.04.0503.1.4 Section 503.1.4 added - Aerial Fire Apparatus Access Roads.
 
503.1.4 Where Required. Buildings or portions of buildings or facilities exceeding 30 feet (9,144 
mm) in height above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall be provided with 
approved fire apparatus access roads capable of accommodating fire department aerial apparatus. 
Overhead utility and power lines shall not be located within the aerial fire apparatus access 
roadway. 

503.1.4.1 Width. Fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum unobstructed width 
of26 feet (7,925 mm) in the immediate vicinity of any building or portion of building 
more than 30 feet (9,144 rnm) in height. 

503.1.4.2 Proximity to building. At least one of the required access routes meeting this 
condition shall be located within a minimum of 15 feet (4,572 rnm) and a maximum of 30 
feet (9,144 mm) from the building, and shall be positioned parallel to one entire side of 
the building. 

(Formerly 9.04.076.1,' Ord. 2739 § 1,2008). 

ORDINANCE Page 4 of 14 
glmvIMV-II-021/IFCIOrd Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 8



9.04.0503.1.5 Section 503.1.5 added - One- or Two-Family Dwelling Residential 
Developments. 
503.1.5 Developments of one- or two-family dwellings where the number of dwelling units 
exceeds 30 shall be provided with separate and approved, unobstructed fire apparatus access 
roads and shall be placed a distance apart equal to not less than one half of the length of 
maximum overall diagonal dimension of the property or area to be served, measured in a straight 
line between accesses. 

Exceptions: 
1. Where there are more than 30 dwelling units on a single public or private fire 
apparatus access road and all dwelling units are equipped throughout with an approved 
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1,903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3 
access from two directions shall not be required. 
2. The number of dwelling units on a single fire apparatus access road shall not be 
increased unless fire apparatus access roads will connect with future development, as 
determined by the fire code official. 

(Formerly 9.04.076.2; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008). 

9.04.0503.2 International Fire Code Section 503.2 amended - Access - Specifications:
 
Section 503.2.1 Dimensions is amended to add:
 
Where a fire hydrant or fire department connection is located on a fire apparatus access road, the
 
minimum road width shall be increased to 26', extending 20' on either side of a fire hydrant or
 
fire department connection.
 
(Formerly 9.04.072.1; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008).
 

9.04.0503.2.3 International Fire Code Section 503.2.3 amended - Access - Surfacing.
 
Section 503.2.3 adopted by MMC 9.04.071 9.04.0503 is further amended to add an additional
 
sentence reading as follows: "The surface shall be entirely composed of gravel, crushed rock,
 
asphalt or concrete, and designed to support the imposed load of fire apparatus weighing at least
 
75,000 pounds."
 
(Formerly 9.04.073; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7, 2004; Ord. 2378 § 6, 2001). 

9.04.0503.2.4 International Fire Code Section 503.2.4 amended - Access - Turning radius. 
Section 503.2.4 adopted by MMC 9.04.071 9.04.0503 is further amended to add an additional 
sentence reading as follows: "A turning radius will be approved only if it is in accordance with 
the Engineering Design and Development Standards for the City of Marysville." 
(Formerly 9.04.074; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6,2001.). 

9.04.0503.2.5 International Fire Code Section 503.2.5 amended - Access - Turnarounds. 
Section 503.2.5 adopted by MMC 9.04.071 9.04.0503 is further amended to add an additional 
three sentences reading as follows: 

Turnarounds shall be a minimum eighty (80) foot diameter cul-de-sac with no obstructions 
within the cul-de-sac. Planters may be installed in cul-de-sacs when the outside radius of the cul­
de-sac is a minimum of fifty (50) feet and inside radius is minimum of25 (twenty five) feet. An 
approved hammerhead turnaround may be used if there are no alternatives, and it is approved by 
the Fire Chief. 

ORDINANCE Page 5 of 14 
glmvIMV-II-021IIFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 9



(Formerly 9.04.075; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6,2001.). 

9.04.0503.2.7 International Fire Code Section 503.2.7 amended - Access - Gradients.
 
Section 503.2.7 adopted by MMC 9.04.071 9.04.0503 is further amended to add an additional
 
sentence reading as follows: "A gradient will be approved only if it is in accordance with the
 
Engineering Design and Development Standards for the City of Marysville."
 
(Formerly 9.04.076; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6, 200 I.).
 

9.04.0503.5 International Fire Code Section 503.5 amended - Required gates or
 
barricades.
 
Section 503.5 is amended by adding:
 
Entrances to roads, trails or other access ways which have been closed with gates and barriers
 
shall not be obstructed by parked vehicles.
 
(Formerly 9.04.076.3; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008).
 

9.04.0503.6 International Fire Code Section 503.6 amended - Gates accessing residential
 
developments.
 
Section 503.6 is amended by adding:
 
Gates installed in a residential community shall be equipped with a strobe activating device.
 
Minimum gate width opening shall be 20 feet. The gate is required to open automatically with
 
the approach of emergency vehicles. In the event of a loss of power, the gate shall open
 
automatically and remain in the open position until power is restored. The gate shall remain in
 
the open position until such time that the power is restored.
 
Exemption: 5 or fewer dwelling units.
 
(Formerly 9.04.076.4; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008).
 

9.04.0503.7 International Fire Code new Section 503.7 added - Split entries.
 
Section 503.7 Split Entries.
 
Split entries to plats, short plats, commercial development and other sites requiring emergency
 
vehicle access, shall be allowed where each aisle (lane) is at least 14 (fourteen) feet in width.
 
(Formerly 9.04.076.5; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008).
 

9.04.0505 International Fire Code Section 505.1 Address identification amended.
 
Section 505.1 is amended to add the following:
 
(I) Address numbers for commercial buildings to be a minimum of six inches high with a 
principal stroke of at least three-quarters inch. 
(2) Where the building is not visible from the street or a single access road or private roadway 
serves more than one building, provision shall be made to clearly identify which driveway or 
roadway serves the appropriate address. 
(3) Address numbers at least four inches high shall be prominently displayed on rear entrance or 
access doors when required by the fire code official. 
(4) Interior and exterior access doors or individual dwelling, housekeeping, living units, or 
commercial tenant spaces also shall be clearly marked. Numbers and/or letters of such units shall 
be at least four inches high. 

ORDfNANCE Page 6 of 14 
glmv/MV-II-021/IFClOrd Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 10



(5) Address Numbering Size Table 

Distance from road 
or Fire Lane 

Minimwn Size 

0-50 feet 4" 

5 1-100 feet 6" 

101-150 feet 8" 

151-200 feet 10" 

201-300 feet 12" 

301 feet and up 18" 

Four inch numbers are permitted for single-family and duplex occupancies only. The minimum
 
size figure for commercial occupancies is six inches. The height to width ratio of the figures
 
shall be approximately 2H: 1w.
 
(Formerly 9.04.076.7; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008).
 

9.04.0507.3 International Fire Code Section 507.3 ~ Fire flow is amended. 
(l) Replace "by an approved method" with "per Appendix B of the International Fire Code." 
(2) Exceptions. Section 507.3 ~ is amended to add two exceptions reading as follows: 

Exceptions: 

(2) Subdivisions and short subdivisions in which all lots have a lot area of 43,560 square 
feet (one acre) or more in size; 
(3) Structures where under the International Building Code the occupancy is classified as 
group U occupancies (agricultural buildings, private garages, carports and sheds) that are 
restricted to private residential use only. Riding arenas or other agricultural structures 
used or accessed by the general public shall not fall within this exception. 

(Formerly 9.04.077; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6,2001.). 

9.04.0507.5 International Fire Code Section 507.5.1 508.5.1 fire hydrant location is not
 
adopted.
 
Fire hydrant locations to be installed per MMC 14.03.050.
 
(Formerly 9.04.072; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2378 § 6,2001.).
 

9.04.0510 International Fire Code Section 510 Emergency Responder Radio Coverage is 
amended to include adoption of Appendix J. 

9.04.0601 International Fire Code Section 601.2 Permits is amended. Solar photovoltaic
 
power systems permit is added.
 
Section 601.2 is amended by adding:
 
A construction permit is required to install or modify Solar photovoltaic power systems as set
 
forth in Section 105.7.
 

9.04.0602 International Fire Code Section 602.1 Definitions is amended - Power tap. 
Add definition to Section 602:...1.;. 

ORDINANCE Page 7 of 14 
g/mvIMV-II-02I/IFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 11



Power Tap means a listed device for indoor use consisting of an attachment plug on one end of a 
flexible cord and two or more receptacles on the opposite end, and has overcurrent protection. 
(Formerly 9.04.076. 6; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008). 

9.04.0605 International Fire Code Section 605 Electrical equipment is amended to add 
605.11: 
Section 605.11 added - Solar Photovoltaic Power Systems: 

605.11 Solar Photovoltaic Power Systems. Solar photovoltaic power systems shall be 
installed in accordance with this code, the International Building Code and NFPA 70. 

Exception: Detached Group U non-habitable structures such as parking shade structures, 
carports, solar trellises, and similar type structures are not subject to the requirements of 
this section. 

605.11.1 Marking. Marking is required on all interior and exterior dc conduit, 
enclosures, raceways, cable assemblies, junction boxes, combiner boxes, and disconnects. 

605.11.1.1 Materials. The materials used for marking shall be reflective, weather 
resistant and suitable for the environment. Marking as required in sections 605.11.1.2 
through 605.11.1.4 shall have all letters capitalized with a minimum height of 3/8 inch 
(9.5 mm) white on red background. 

605.11.1.2 Marking content. The marking shall contain the words WARNING: 
PHOTOVOLTAlC POWER SOURCE. 

605.11.1.3 Main service disconnect The marking shall be placed adjacent to the main 
service disconnect in a location clearly visible from the location where the disconnect is 
operated. 

605.11.1.4 Location of Marking. Marking shall be placed on all interior and exterior dc 
conduit, raceways, enclosures and cable assemblies every 10 feet (3048 mm) within 1 
foot (305 mm) of all turns or bends and within 1 foot (305 mm) above and below all 
penetrations of roof/ceiling assemblies and all walls and lor barriers. 

605.11.2 Locations of DC conductors. Conduit, wiring systems, and raceways for 
photovoltaic circuits shall be located as close as possible to the ridge or hip or valley and 
from the hip or valley as directly as possible to an outside wall to reduce trip hazards and 
maximize ventilation opportunities. Conduit runs between sub arrays and to DC combiner 
boxes shall be installed in a manner that minimizes total amount of conduit on the roof by 
taking the shortest path from the array to the DC combiner box. The DC combiner boxes 
shall be located such that conduit runs are minimized in the pathways between arrays. DC 
wiring shall be installed in metallic conduit or raceways when located within enclosed spaces 
in a building. Conduit shall run along the bottom of load bearing members. 

ORDINANCE Page 8 of]4 
g/mvIMV-II-02l!IFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 12



605.11.3 Access and pathways. Roof access, pathways, and spacing requirements shall be 
provided in order to ensure access to the roof; provide pathways to specific areas of the roof; 
provide for smoke ventilation operations; and to provide emergency egress from the roof. 

Exceptions: 

1.	 Requirements relating to ridge, hip, and valleys do not apply to roofs slopes of 
two units vertical in twelve units horizontal (2: 12) or less. 

2.	 Residential structures shall be designed so that each array is no greater than 150 
feet (45 720 mm) by 150 feet (45 720 mm) in either axis. 

3.	 The fire chief may allow panels/modules to be located up to the ridge when an 
alternative ventilation method acceptable to the fire chief has been provided or 
where the fire chief has determined vertical ventilation techniques will not be 
employed. 

605.11.3.1 Roof access points. Roof access points shall be defined as an area that does 
not place ground ladders over openings such as windows or doors, and are located at 
strong points of building construction in locations where the access point does not 
conflict with overhead obstructions such as tree limbs, wires, or signs. 

605.11.3.2 Residential systems for one- and two-family residential dwellings. Access 
shall be provided in accordance with Sections 605.11.3.2.1 through 605.11.3.2.4 

605.11.3.2.1 Access required Residential. Panels /modules shall be located in a 
manner that provides a minimum of two separate 3 foot (914 mm) wide clear 
access pathways from the eave to the ridge on each roof. The access pathways 
shall be located at structurally strong locations on the building capable of 
supporting the live load of fire fighters accessing the roof. 

605.11.3.2.2 Residential buildings with a single ridge. Panels/modules shall be 
permitted to be located up to the ridge on one roof slope only, with the other slope 
accessible and suitable for ventilation up to the ridge or alternative method 
approved by AHJ. 

605.11.3.2.3 Residential buildings with multiple ridges, hips or valleys: 
Panels/modules shall be located no closer than 18 inches (457 mm) to a ridge, hip 
or a valley if panels/modules are to be placed on both sides of a ridge, hip or 
valley. If the panels are to be located on only one side of a ridge, hip or valley 
then the panels shall be permitted to be placed directly adjacent to the ridge, hip 
or valley. 

605.11.3.2.4 Smoke Ventilation. Panels/modules shall be located such that one 
side of each ridge shall have not less than 4 feet (l290mm) of clear space 
immediately below the ridge available to allow for fire department smoke 
ventilation operations. 

ORDINANCE	 Page 9 of 14 
g/mv/MV-II-021/IFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-1 IF 

Item 6 - 13



605.11.3.3 All other occupancies. Access shall be provided in accordance with Sections 
605.11.3.3.1 through 605.11.3.3.3. 

Exception: Where it is detennined by the fire code official that the roof configuration is 
similar to a one- or two-family dwelling, the fire code official may approve the 
residential access and ventilation requirements provided in 605.11.3.2.1 through 
605.11.3.2.4. 

605.11.3.3.1 Access. There shall be a minimum 6 foot (1829 nun) wide clear 
perimeter around the edges of the roof. 

Exception: If either axis of the building is 250 feet (76 200 nun) or less, there 
shall be a minimum 4 foot (1290 nun) wide clear perimeter around the edges of 
the roof or alternative method approved by AHJ. 

605.11.3.3.2 Pathways. The solar installation shall be designed to provide designated 
pathways. The pathways shall meet the following requirements: 

1.	 The pathway shall be over areas capable of supporting the live load of fire 
fighters accessing the roof 

2.	 The center line axis pathways shall be provided in both axis of the roof. 
Center line axis pathways shall run where the roof structure is capable of 
supporting the Ii ve load of firefighters accessing the roof. 

3.	 Shall be straight line not less than 4 feet (1290 mm) clear to skylights and/or 
ventilation hatches 

4. Shall be straight line not less than 4 feet (1290 nun) clear to roof 
standpipes 

5.	 Shall provide not less than 4 feet (1290 mm) clear around roof access hatch 
with at least one not less than 4 feet (1290 nun) clear pathway to parapet or 
roof edge 

605.11.3.3.3 Smoke Ventilation. The solar installation shall be designed to meet the 
following requirements: 

1.	 Arrays shall be no greater than 150 feet (45 720 mm) by 150 feet (45 720 nun) 
in distance in either axis in order to create opportunities for smoke ventilation 
operations. 

2. Smoke ventilation options between array sections shall be one of the following: 
2.1.	 A pathway 8 feet (2438 mm) or greater in width; 
2.2.	 A 4 feet (1290 mm) or greater in width pathway and bordering roof 

skylights or smoke and heat vents; 
2.3.	 A 4 feet (1290 mm) or greater in width pathway and bordering 4 foot 

(1290 nun) x 8 foot (2438 mm) "venting cutouts" every 20 feet (6096 
mm) on alternating sides of the pathway 

ORDINANCE	 Page 10 of 14 
glmv/MV-J 1-021/IFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 14



605.11.4 Ground mounted photovoltaic arrays. Ground mounted photovoltaic arrays shall 
comply with Sections 605. 11 through 605.11.2 and this section. Setback requirements do not 
apply to ground-mounted, free standing photovoltaic arrays, except as provided in Chapter 
22C MMC. A clear brush area of 10 feet (3048 mm) is required for ground mounted 
photovoltaic arrays. 

9.04.0902 International Fire Code Section 902. 1 Definitions is amended. 
The definition of fire area is amended by adding: "For Section 903, the definition of FIRE 
AREA shall be as follows: The aggregate floor area enclosed and bounded by exterior walls of a 
building." 
(Formerly 9.04.086; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2377 § 9, 2001). 

9.04.0903 International Fire Code Section 903.2 amended - Sprinkler systems - Where 
required. 
Amend Section 903.2 by adding items: 

Existing buildings altered such that the total fire area square footage exceeds the 
threshold square footage for each occupancy group listed in this section shall be provided 
with an automatic sprinkler system. Where there is a change-of-occupancy classification 
in an existing building, the sprinkler requirements for the new occupancy classification 
shall apply. 

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings where the 
combined area of all fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, exceeds the 
threshold square footage for each occupancy group listed in this section. 

(Formerly 9.04.090; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 8,2003). 

9.04.0903.2.1 International Fire Code Section 903.2.1 amended - Sprinkler systems ­
Group A occupancies. 
Section 903.2.1.1 Item 1. Replace 12,000 with 8,000. 
Section 903.2.1.3 Item 1. Replace 12,000 with 8,000. 
Section 903.2.1.4 Item 1. Replace 12,000 with 8,000. 
(Formerly 9.04.079; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2377 § 2, 2001). 

9.04.0903.2.3 International Fire Code Section 903.2.,J 903.2.2 amended - Sprinkler systems 
- Group E occupancies. 
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E Occupancies. 
Delete items 1 and 2, and the Exception, and replace them with the following: 

Exceptions: 

1. Portable school classrooms, provided aggregate area of any cluster or portion of a 
cluster of portable school classrooms does not exceed 5,000 square feet; and clusters of 
portable school classrooms shall be separated as required Qy in Chapter 5 of the building 
code. 

ORDINANCE Page 11 of 14 
glmv/MV-II-02If1FCIOrd Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-1 IF 

Item 6 - 15



2. Group E Occupancies with an occupant load of 50 or less, calculated in accordance 
with table 1004.1.1. 

(Formerly 9.04.080; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7, 2004; Ord. 2377 § 3,2001). 

9.04.0903.2.4 International Fire Code Section 903.2.4 903.2.3 amended - Sprinkler 
systems - Group F-l occupancies. 

Section 903.2.4 903.2.3 Item 1. Replace 12,000 with 8,000.
 
Section 903.2.4 903.2.3 Item 3. Replace 24,000 with 8,000.
 
Section 903.2.4 903.2.3 Item 4. Where a Group F-2 fire area exceeds 8,000 square feet.
 
(Formerly 9.04.081; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7, 2004; Ord. 2377 § 4, 2001).
 

9.04.0903.2.7 International Fire Code Section 903.2.7 903.2.6 amended - Sprinkler systems
 
- Group M and B occupancies.
 
Section 903.2.7 903.2.6 Item 1. Add B after M and change 12,000 to 8,000.
 
Section 903.2.7 903.2.6 Item 2. Add B after M.
 
Section 903.2.7 903.2.6 Item 3. Add B after M and change 24,000 to 8,000.
 
(Formerly 9.04.083,' Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2377 § 6,2001).
 

9.04.0903.2.8 International Fire Code Section 903.2. 8 903.2.7 amended - Sprinkler
 
systems - Group R occupancies.
 
Amend Section 903.2.8 903.2.7 to add:
 
Tov~'llhouses constructed in a group of five or more attached units shall be protected ,....ith an
 
automatic sprinkler system per 903.3.1.3An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
 
throughout every apartment house three (3) or more stories in height or containing five (5) or
 
more dwelling units, townhomes and every congregate residence three (3) or more stories in
 
height or having an occupant load of five (5) or more, and every hotel three or more stories in
 
height or containing five (5) or more guest rooms, and one and two family dwelling units three
 
(3) or more stories. Residential or quick-response standard sprinklers shall be used in the 
dwelling units and guest room portions of the building shall be protected with an automatic 
sprinkler system per 903.3.1.3. 

(Formerly 9.04.084; Ord. 2739 § 1,2008; Ord. 2532 § 7,2004; Ord. 2377 § 7,2001). 

9.04.0903.2.9 International Fire Code Section 903.2.9 and 903.2.10 amended - Sprinkler 
systems - Group S occupancies. 

Section 903.2.9 is hereby enacted and added to the International Fire Code as previously enacted 
and amended by the city reading as follows: 

Section 903.2.9 Group S Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed 
throughout all Group S occupancies that have 8.000 square feet or more of fire area. 

Section 903.2.9. add item 5: "In all Group S-l mini-storage occupancies." 

ORDINANCE Page 12 of 14 
glmv/MV-II-02l/1FC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-1 IF 

Item 6 - 16



Section 903.2.9.1. add item 5: "Repair garages where the use of open flame or welding is
 
conducted with a fire area exceeding 3,000 square feet."
 

Replace all occurrences of "S-I" with "S".
 

Section 903.2.9 Item 1. Replace 12,000 with 8,000.
 

Section 903.2.9 Item 3. Replace 24,000 with 8,000.
 

Section 903.2.9 add item 5: "In all Group S-1 mini-storage occupancies."
 

Section 903.2.9.1 Item 1. Replace 10,000 with 8,000.
 

Section 903.2.9.1 Item 2. Replace 12,000 with 8,000.
 

Section 903.2.9.1 add item 5: "Repair garages where the use of open flame or welding is
 
conducted with a fire area exceeding 3,000 square feet."
 

Section 903.2.9.2 Replace 20,000 with 8,000. 

Section 3. Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or word of this 
ordinance should be held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, 
such invalidity or unconstitutionality thereof shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of 
any other section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or word of this ordinance. 

Section 4. Effective Date. This ordinance shall become effective five days after the date of its 
publication by summary. 

PASSED by the City Council and APPROVED by the mayor this day of _ 
2010. 

CITY OF MARYSVILLE 

Jon Nehring, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

April O'Brien, Deputy City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM 

Grant K. Weed, City Attorney. 

ORDfNANCE Page 13 of 14 
glmv/MV-II-021/IFCIOrd Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-1 IF 

Item 6 - 17



Date of Publication: -------­

ORDINANCE Page]4of]4 
glmv/MV-II-021/IFC/Ord Ch 9 04 Fire Code 07-22-11 F 

Item 6 - 18



Item 7 - 1



Item 7 - 2



Item 7 - 3



Item 7 - 4



Item 7 - 5



Item 7 - 6



Item 7 - 7



Item 7 - 8



Item 7 - 9



Item 7 - 10



Item 7 - 11



Item 7 - 12



Item 7 - 13



Item 7 - 14



Item 7 - 15



Item 7 - 16



Item 7 - 17



Item 7 - 18



Item 7 - 19



Item 7 - 20



Item 7 - 21



Item 7 - 22



CITY OF MARYSVILLE AGENDA BILL 
 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY FOR ACTION 
 
CITY COUNCIL MEETING DATE:  10/24/2011 
AGENDA ITEM:  
Resolution Accepting Gift from Marysville Little League for Rudy Wright Field Repairs 

PREPARED BY:  Jim Ballew DIRECTOR APPROVAL:  

DEPARTMENT:  Parks and Recreation  

ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 

BUDGET CODE:       AMOUNT:  $1,987.56 

SUMMARY: 
 
The playground apparatus located at Rudy Wright Field has been closed due to vandalism of the 
structure. Marysville Little League has provided funds to purchase replacement components that 
will allow the city to re-open once installed by Parks personnel. Marysville Little League has 
donated $1,987.56 to acquire the necessary replacement equipment. 
 
The supporting Resolution accepts the gift of funds subject to conditions. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION:  Staff recommends that Council Authorize the Mayor to sign the 
Resolution Accepting the Gift of $1,987.56 from Marysville Little League subject to conditions. 
 
 

Item 8 - 1



C I T Y   O F   M A R Y S V I L L E 
Marysville, Washington 

 
RESOLUTION NO. _______ 

 
A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF MARYSVILLE FOR THE 

ACCEPTANCE OF A GIFT SUBJECT TO CONDITIONS. 
 

 WHEREAS, Marysville Little League has made a gift of one thousand nineteen 
hundred eighty-seven dollars and fifty six cents dollars ($1,987.56) towards the 
Marysville Parks Department facilities repair budget; and 
 

WHEREAS, said gift was provided by the Marysville Little League for the 
purpose of making repairs to the playground system located at Rudy Wright Field and to 
be utilized in purchasing replacement equipment vandalized which required closure of 
the play area; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council does have the ultimate authority for acceptance and 

use of said contributions consistent with the donor’s intent. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 

CITY OF MARYSVILLE AS FOLLOWS: 
 
The City of Marysville hereby gratefully accepts the gift from Marysville Little 

League subject to the conditions under which such gift was donated. 
 
PASSED by the City Council and APPROVED by the Mayor this ____ day of 

_______________, 2011. 
 
     CITY OF MARYSVILLE 
 
 
     By ______________________________ 
          JON NEHRING, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
By _________________________ 
SANDY LANGDON, City Clerk 
 
Approved as to form: 
 
By _________________________ 
GRANT K. WEED, City Attorney 
 
 

Item 8 - 2



 
 

CITIES OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY 

2011-2012 State Legislative Agenda 
 

  

 

This Legislative Agenda, which reflects input from the Cities of Snohomish County, expresses a 

collective position on key items that are expected to arise in the form of legislation, budget decisions, or 

policy decisions in the upcoming Session of the Legislature.   

 

Aerospace Industry   

 Support the Washington Aerospace Partnership and other stakeholder groups in developing a unified 

strategy (e.g., training & education, research & development, Office of Aerospace and Defense, 

unemployment insurance tax, worker‟s compensation, transportation infrastructure) to ensure that 

Washington State remains the leading location in the world for aerospace.  Led by The Boeing 

Company, the aerospace industry within Snohomish County employs as many as 45,000 people, 

while one out of every three to six Washington State jobs is supported either directly or indirectly by 

the aerospace industry.   

 

Economic Development 
 Support “tax-increment financing (TIF)”, which is a tool used by most other states to foster economic 

and community development to allow cities to proactively implement their Comprehensive Plans and 

to ensure local, regional and national competitiveness.  

 

 Support additional financial resources for Local Revitalization Financing (LRF) program and Local 

Infrastructure Finance Tool (LIFT) to allow those cities who currently qualify to participate. 

 

Local Transportation and Capital Facilities 
 Support legislation such as a transportation revenue package that ensures local distribution and local 

funding options to provide cities sustainable and adequate funding for vital infrastructure investments 

that is capable of promoting economic growth and prosperity to the cities of Snohomish County.   

 

 Fully fund Public Works Trust Fund (PWTF) and Transportation Improvement Board (TIB) programs 

to provide cities funding for infrastructure and economic development purposes; no additional 

diversion or „sweeping‟ of capital accounts such as the Public Works Trust Fund. 

 

 Support investment in key transportation corridors such as U.S. 2, SR-9, and I-5, which are critical to 

the quality of life and the movement of people and goods throughout Snohomish County. 

 

Growth Management Act 
 Reform of annexation statutes and those dealing with the role of cities, counties and special purpose 

districts in urban areas to include: require joint planning in unincorporated urban growth areas; 

removing referendum from annexation process; limiting the authority of boundary review boards; and 

legislation that allows counties the ability to levy a utility tax, if it is restricted to unincorporated areas 

and there are accommodations for the needs of cities, in those areas, such as annexation financing 

assistance. 

 

Unfunded Mandates and Preemption of Local Authority 
 Strongly oppose any legislation that: imposes an “unfunded mandate” without additional funding to 

support these programs; attempts to erode local revenue or tax authority such as local state-shared 

revenues that are critical to the financial health of cities; and pre-empts local authority over any 

policy or operational matter traditionally and historically vested with local government.  

Item 9 - 1



 

CITIES OF SNOHOMISH COUNTY 

2011-2012 State Legislative Agenda 

 

  

   

 
City of Arlington 

Kristin Banfield 

Assistant City Administrator 

360-403-3441 

 
City of Brier 

Bob Colinas, Mayor 

425-775-5440 

 
Bob Stowe, City Manager 

425-486-3256 

   

 

 
City of Edmonds 

Mike Cooper, Mayor 

425-771-0247 

 

 

 
City of Everett 

Pat McClain, Executive Director 

425-257-7104 

Doug Levy, Outcomes by Levy 

425-922-3999 

 

 
City of Granite Falls 

Brent Kirk, Public Works Supervisor 

360-691-6441 

 

   

 
City of Lake Stevens 

Jan Berg, City Administrator 

425-377-3230 

 
City of Lynnwood 

Don Gough, Mayor 

425-670-5003 

 
City of Marysville 

Gloria Hirashima 

Chief Administrative Officer 

360-363-8088 

   

 

 
City of Monroe 

Gene Brazel, City Administrator 

360-794-7400 

 
City of Mountlake Terrace 

John Caulfield, City Manager 

425-744-6205 

 

 
City of Mukilteo 

Joe Marine, Mayor 

425-263-8018 

   

 
City of Snohomish 

Larry Bauman, City Manager 

360-568-3115 

 

 
City of Sultan 

Deborah Knight, City Administrator 

360-793-1164 

 

 
Town of Woodway 

Eric Faison, Town Administrator 

206-542-0183 

   

 

Item 9 - 2


	Agenda
	Item 1
	Item 2
	Item 3
	Item 4
	Item 5
	Item 6
	Item 7
	Item 8
	Item 9



